AGENDA FOR APRIL 26, 2018 6:30pPM PAGE 1 OF 2
REGULAR MEETING OF THE MONEE VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES

VILLAGE of MONEE

Will County Illinois

A. Call to Order by Mayor Popp

B. Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag of the United States of America

*Invocation™®

C. RollCall

D. OPENTO THE PUBLIC: Agenda items only! Please limit your comments to 3 minutes. You must come to the
podium and give your name and address.

E. Consent Agenda (Any items to be removed should be stated to the Clerk prior to calling meeting to order.)
All items on the Consent Agenda will be enacted in one motion. There will be no separate discussion of these
items unless a board member so requests, in which event, the item will be removed from the Consent Agenda
and considered as the first item after the approval of the Consent Agenda.

Minutes of the Committee of the Whole Meeting of 04/03/2018

Minutes of the Regular Village Board Meeting of 04/11/2018

Minutes of the Regular P & Z Meeting of 03/21/2018

Favorable Recommendation from P&Z Re: A Special Use Application as submitted by Neil Patterson

for the Property Located at 25858 Sunset Dr. Unit 8

5. Favorable Recommendation from P&Z Re: Notice of a Development for a Community Solar Garden
within 1.50 miles of the Village of Monee

6. Bills

Item (s) Removed from the Consent Agenda

e e

F. Clerk’s Report
G. Mayor’s Report

1. Appointment of Scott Youdris as Trustee to fill the vacated seat of Mary Jo Vincent
2. Appointment of Makeila Kanneh to Planning & Zoning Commission

3. Appointment of David Stockton to the Police Commission

4. Honorary Naming of Wilson Street from Rt. 50 to Egyptian Trl “Phyllis Nieland Way”

H. Administrator’s Report
1. Board Action Request Re: Rt. 50 Water Main Loop-Bid Results
2. Board Action Request Re: Main Street Drainage Improvements-Bid Results
3. Board Action Request: Offer to Purchase Municipal Land

I.  Officials’ Report

Public Works

Parks & Recreation
Finance

Economic Development
Building Services

;b o e

www.Village Of Monee.org



AGENDA FOR APRIL 26, 2018 6:30pPM PAGE 2 OF 2
REGULAR MEETING OF THE MONEE VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES

VILLAGE of MONEE

Will County Illinois

Proposed Fee Schedule

Proposed Adoption of the 2015 edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code
Proposed Adoption of the 2015 edition of the International Residential Code

Proposed Adoption of the 2015 edition of the International Property Maintenance Code
Proposed Adoption of the 2015 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code

Proposed Adoption of the 2015 edition of the International Fire Code

Proposed Adoption of the 2015 edition of the International Existing Building Code
Proposed Adoption of the 2015 edition of the International Mechanical Code

Proposed Adoption of the 2014 edition of the NFPA 70: National Electric Code
Proposed Adoption of the 2014 edition of the Illinois Plumbing Code

k. Proposed Adoption of the current edition of the lllinois Accessibility Code

I.  Proposed Adoption of the 2015 edition of the International Building Code

=@ ™0 a0 oo

[

6. Public Safety

Attorney’s Report

1. Discussion/Approval of an Ordinance Amending Ord.# 1673 Relative to Issuance of a Special Use Permit

2. Discussion/Approval of an Ordinance Repealing Ord. #1617 Re: IGA Tri-Town Government Access
Television Commission

3. Discussion/Approval of an Ordinance Re: The Raising of Chicken Hens

4. Discussion/Approval of an Ordinance Re: Regulating Transient Merchant Type of Activities

Old Business:
1. Discussion/Approval of an Ordinance Re: Amending Title 8, Chapter 2 (A), Section 1 (D) (1)
(Tabled from the April 11, 2018 Mtg.)
2. Creamery Lease

3. Retention Pond Fishing & Activities

New Business:
1. Major Michael Larson, CAP (lllinois Wing Group 2 Commander)
2. First Amendment to Redevelopment Agreement with Dr. Sheetz
3. TIF Payout Request for JPEL (Dr. Scheetz)

. Open to Public: Non-agenda items. Please limit your comments to 3 minutes. You must come to the podium
and give your name and address.

Executive Session:
1. Collective Bargaining 5 ILCS 120/2 (C) (2)
2. Purchase or Lease of Real Property 5 ILCS 120/ 2 (C) (5)
3. Compensation of Specific Employees 5ILCS 120/2 (¢ ) (1)

Adjournment:
Posted on 04/24/2018 @ 4:30pm
Michelle Powell, Village Deputy Clerk

www.Village Of Monee.org



MINUTES FOR APRIL 11, 2018 6:30PM PAGE 1 OF 4
REGULAR MEETING OF THE MONEE VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES

VILLAGE of MONEE

Will County lllinois

Call to Order by Mayor Popp @6:32pm

Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag of the United States of America

*Invocation* - Reverend Hunt — Reverend Hunt invited everyone on behalf of the Monee Alliance of Churches
to our National Day of Prayer taking place on Thursday, May 3 @7pm New Hope Christian Community Church
4700 W. Court Street.

Roll Call Present: Trustees Blue, Gray, Holston, Raczek (4), Mayor Popp Absent: Trustee Horne (1)

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC: Agenda items only! Please limit your comments to 3 minutes. You must come to the
podium and give your name and address. — No Takers

Consent Agenda (Any items to be removed should be stated to the Clerk prior to calling meeting to order.)

All items on the Consent Agenda will be enacted in one motion. There will be no separate discussion of these
items unless a board member so requests, in which event, the item will be removed from the Consent Agenda
and considered as the first item after the approval of the Consent Agenda

Minutes of the Regular Village Board Meeting of 03/28/2018
Payroll Ending 03/04/2018
Payroll Ending 03/17/2018
Payroll Ending 03/30/2018
5. Bills
Motion made to approve above Consent Agenda: Trustee Gray Moved, Trustee Holston Seconded...Roll Call
Vote Ayes: Trustees Gray, Holston, Raczek, Blue (4) Nays: NONE (0) Motion Carried

BN ope

Item(s) removed from The Consent Agenda -None

Clerk’s Report — No Report

. Mayor’s Report — Mayor Popp shared information from the Will County Center for Community Concerns about
their assistance to low/moderate income individuals. LIHEAP (Low Income Home Energy Assistance Program) —
Helps income eligible persons receive one-time direct payment towards energy bill or continuous monthly
assistance towards energy bill. The goal is to reach out to those in the Village of Monee who may not be aware
of this assistance and if needed, there are flyers for those wanting additional information.

. Administrator’s Report

1. Board Action Request Re: Test Water Well Bid Results/Intent to Award — Motion made to approve.
Trustee Holston Moved, Trustee Raczek Seconded...Roll Call Vote Ayes: Trustees Holston, Raczek, Blue,
Gray (4) Nays: NONE (0) Motion Carried

2. Board Action Request Re: Village Hall Remodel/ Washroom ADA Compliant — Motion Made to
Approve. Trustee Blue Moved, Trustee Holston Seconded...Roll Call Vote Ayes: Trustees Blue, Holston
(2) Nays: Trustees Raczek, Gray (2) Mayor Popp needed to vote: Aye...Total Ayes (3) Motion Carried

www.Village Of Monee.org



MINUTES FORAPRIL 11, 2018 6:30pPM PAGE 2 OF 4
REGULAR MEETING OF THE MONEE VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES

VILLAGE of MONEE

Will County Illinois

I. Officials’ Report

1.

Public Works — Trustee Gray shared work is being done on Egyptian Trl starting at 7am and with the
weather, should take about two and a half months. Please be patient and remember another option is
taking Governor’'s Hwy to Monee Manhattan Road and making a left to go around the work.

Parks & Recreation — Diana Kroll shared that the newsletter should be out next week and also shared
about the Community Wide Garage Sales for the dates of May 11" and 12", 2018. If you'd like to be
added to the Village directory, simply come to the village, fill out application and pay $5.00 fee.

Trustee Blue mentioned that Diana Kroll has done a great job with all of the work she has done with the
newsletter, she has managed to keep the quality, finding a cheaper service and cutting the cost by
almost half.

Finance — Trustee Holston shared that the finance committee met this past Monday and they have a

budget that they are recommending to the board.

Economic Development — No Report

Building Services — Mayor Popp shared that they had a meeting today about a building that has
already been approved that’s going up on Ridgeland Ave. April 16" @6:30 for Building Committee
Meeting.

Public Safety — No Report

J. Attorney’s Report —

1,

Discussion/Approval of an Ordinance Re: Repealing Ord #1834 — Motion was made to approve.
Trustee Holston Moved, Trustee Raczek Seconded...Roll Call Vote Ayes: Trustee Raczek, Blue, Gray,
Holston (4) Nays: NONE (0) Motion Carried Ord #1836

Discussion/Approval of an Ordinance Re: Amending Title 8, Chapter 2 (A), Section 1 (D) (1) — Trustee
Holston questioned to clarify this was about the Aqua portion (waste) of the water bill increase. Village
Attorney Gryczewski confirmed that it was. Trustee Holston Moved, Trustee Gray Seconded then there
was discussion. Trustee Blue question why would rates due go back to March 1*, 2018? Attorney
Gryczewski stated that the ICC didn’t give any village a lot of room to get the ordinance passed and we
didn’t want a lapse in payment from user to the Village or else monies would be loss. Trustee Blue also
questioned if this was unethical. Attorney Gryczewski stated that unfortunately it happens often with
utilities as the ICC made the decision. Trustee Holston questioned the clarification of the fact that we
filed an appeal/objection to fight this increase, shared that he agrees with Trustee Blue in reference to
going back to March 1% to collect increase since billing cycle is every two months and April is almost
over and also questioned the cost to the village if we waited until May 1* to bill increase. Attorney
Gryczewski shared that that was correct in regards to the Village having filed the objection and
Administrator Wallace shared that Aqua bills monthly and the Village bills ever two months so the
additional cost is $2.25 per 1000 gallons of water treated; we average just under 100,000 give or take
per month. As a result, Trustee Holston retracted original motion to table this. Motion was made to
table until the next board meeting on April 26", 2018. Trustee Holston Moved, Trustee Blue
Seconded...Roll Call Vote Ayes: Trustees Blue, Holston, Raczek (3) Nays: Trustee Gray (1) Motion Carried

Discussion/Approval of an Ordinance Re: Amending Title 4, Chapter 1, Sections 2 & 5 — Motion was
made to approve. Trustee Blue Moved, Trustee Gray Seconded...Roll Call Vote Ayes: Trustees Gray,
Holston, Raczek, Blue (4) Nays: NONE (0) Motion Carried

www.Village Of Monee.org



MINUTES FOR APRIL 11, 2018 6:30pPM PAGE 3 OF 4
REGULAR MEETING OF THE MONEE VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES

VILLAGE of MONEE

Will County Hlinois

4. Discussion/Approval of an Ordinance Re: Establishing Late Fees Due the Village — A motion as made
to approve. Trustee Holston moved, Trustee Raczek Seconded...Roll Call Vote Ayes: Trustees Holston,
Raczek, Blue, Gray (4) Nays: NONE (0) Motion Carried

K. Old Business:

1. Payment to Monee Fire Protection District for New Apparatus — Motion was made to pay out of TIF
District $400,000 in full. Trustee Holston stated that it was reviewed and is in the TIF budget. Trustee
Holston Moved, Trustee Blue Seconded...Roll Call Vote Ayes: Trustees Raczek, Blue, Gray, Holston (4)
Nays: NONE (0) Motion Carried

L. New Business:

1. Creamery Architect — Administrator Wallace shared that the architect that will be working on the
Creamery will take between 90-100 hours to complete the work, a pay as you go project at $150/hr and
requesting an initial payment of $2000.00. Administrator Wallace stated that he would suggest that the
amount be raised to $6,000.00 so that this wouldn’t have to come before the board at each board
meeting to request. Trustee Holston Moved, Trustee Blue Seconded... Trustee Blue stated if we are
expecting him to work 90-100 hours than why not make it up to $15,000.00 so we don’t have to keep
coming back on it. Trustee Holston Amended his motion and Trustee Blue Seconded. Trustee Holston
shared that there was $25,000.00 set aside for the Creamery in the budget already and that this would
come from it. Trustee Gray shared that he doesn’t understand how finance stated that they can’t get
monies together for vehicles needed up and running for public works department, yet $25,000.00 can
be spent on the Creamery. Administrator Wallace stated that regarding the public works vehicles, that
would be solidified at the next finance meeting. Trustee Blue confirmed that the $25,000.00 was
already approved in the budget previously. Roll Call Vote Ayes: Trustees Raczek, Blue, Holston (3) Nays:
Trustee Gray (1) Motion Carried

2. Creamery Lease — Administrator shared that this is a proposed Lease between the Village and The
Historical Society. Information for review.

M. Open to Public: Paul Telle 26624 S. Anna - Came to the podium and asked to have an explanation regarding
the last board meeting under New Business for approval for application for consideration of a Sub division as a
minor sub division. Administrator Wallace stated that the property owner owned a large parcel of land and
wanted to carve off one lot to make it a separate lot and it was done through the zoning board of appeals. Less
than 20 lots classify it as a minor sub-division. Mr. Telle wanted to make sure it had nothing to do with the
proposed truck stop. Administrator Wallace confirmed that it wasn’t but there is a project slated to be built
there. Mr. Telle also questioned about the test well and tariffs of steel. Christine Schutt 6430 Lakeway Dr. was
wondering if there was any additional information regarding Thornton’s proposal. Administrator Wallace
shared that there was not and haven’t heard back from them as of yet as she saw marked stakes in the ground
of that area. Mr. Wallace sated it was not but more than likely for the project he was just speaking of. Ms. Scott
questioned if anyone sitting up on the board lived on the west side of i57 to understand what it’s like to live
with Amazon and why they concerned about bringing another truck stop with an additional warehouse. Mayor
Popp mentioned that we know how it is and understand. He shared that he’s working to make Ridgeland Ave a

www.Village Of Monee.org




MINUTES FOR APRIL 11, 2018 6:30PM PAGE 4 OF 4
REGULAR MEETING OF THE MONEE VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES

VILLAGE of MONEE

Will County lllinois

County Road and more. Heidi Gonzales 25634 S. Daffodil Ln — Shared that she was there on behalf of the
Monee Women’s Club as she is this year’s President of it and sharing some events. They are having a fund
raiser selling geraniums to help fund their scholarships. One for any Monee Graduating Senior young lady and
one for a Monee Woman looking to further her education. They also partner with the American Legion almost
every month and helping them with their poppy sales on June 30", 2018. Also doing philanthropic efforts as
they have their Relay for Life team (Rebels with A Cause) 3" year in a row, for the American Cancer society and
looking to do really well with it this year. Monee Women'’s Club is one of the biggest groups in town for
volunteer efforts with currently 274 members within the 60449 zip code. Wanting more information, visit their
Monee Women’s Club Facebook page. Mike 4516 Montgomery Azalea Ave — shared that he has been within
the community 16 years and have a pond behind their home and have many nice neighbors that come and fish
the pond. States that there is a group that comes from University Park and will camp out the entire day, very
abusive with their language, leave behind garbage every day because they can take the fish. He is requesting
and wondering how to get the pond changed to catch and release only and maybe that will solve the problem.
Mayor Popp shared that the Chief of Police being present at this meeting has heard his concerns and will keep
an eye out however to make the pond catch and release a hard one to control however they will look to see

what can be done to help.

N. Executive Session:
1. Collective Bargaining 5ILCS 120/2 (C) (5)
2. Purchase of Lease of Real Property 5 ILCS 120/2 (C) (5)
3. Compensation of Specific Employees 5ILCS 120/2 (C) (1)

Motion made to move to Executive Session @7:22pm Trustee Blue Moved, Trustee Raczek
Seconded...Roll Call Vote Ayes: Trustees Blue, Gray, Holston, Raczek (4) Nays: NONE (0) motion Carried

Motion Made to reconvene Regular Board Meeting @8:56pm Trustee Raczek moved, Trustee Gray
Seconded...Roll Call Vote Ayes: Trustees Holston, Raczek, Blue, Gray (4) Nays: NONE (0) Motion Carried

0. Action Regarding Executive Session: No Action
P. Adjournment- Motion Made to Adjourn Meeting @8:57pm. Trustee Raczek Moved, Trustee Blue

Seconded...Roll Call Vote Ayes: Raczek, Blue, Gray, Holston (4) Nays: NONE (0) Motion Carried

Mayor Popp

Clerk Codjoe

www.Village Of Monee.org



MINUTES FOR APRIL 3, 2018 6:30pPM PAGE 1 OF 1
COMMITTEE MEETING OF THE WHOLE

sacki VILLAGE of MONEE

L) Will County llinois

Call to Order by Mayor Popp @ 6:30pm
Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag of the United States of America

Roll Call: Present: Trustee’s Blue, Gray, Holston, Horne, Raczek

Discussion of Projects: There was no discussion on this item.

Discussion of Budget FY 2019: Administrator Wallace went through the Corporate Account. Several line items
were discussed. It was proposed that there be no raises for the non-union employees and additionally they would
have to pay twenty five percent 25% of their medical insurance. The budget for Fall Fest & Movies in Park were
cut. Trustee’s Raczek and Gray were opposed to eliminating movies in the park. Discussion ensued and it was
determined that two thousand dollars ($2,000.00) would be put back inthe budget for Movies in the Park. It was
put in the budget for a staff account who will work with the Finance Director. It was stated that there is a huge
deficient in Public Works, expenses are way up since 2015, new motorized equipment was cut. Trustee Gray asked
how the Village is supposed to be able to do their job if they can’t purchase new vehicles and equipment. Trustee
Holston suggested to Trustee Gray to possibly use some of the money designated for the other public works
building on Industrial Dr., for new equipment. New motorized equipment was also cut from the Police budget,
additionally travel & training was reduced and dispatching with Laraway Communications has gone up two percent
(2%). Trustee Blue had concerns about nothing in the budget for Fall Fest. Mayor Popp stated the possibility to go
down to two (2) days instead of three, he also suggested that a private party should possible take it over. The
budget for the creamery building was also cut. After some discussion, money was put back into this line item. The
clerical assistant was eliminated from the building department. The budget for WPAL was cut, with the new
camera and audio system the Village has in place we will be able to post the meetings to Youtube and are new
Village web site.  Another finance meeting will be scheduled to further discuss of the 2019 fiscal budget.

Adjournment: Gray moved, Raczek seconded to adjourn at 7:58pm. Roll call vote. Ayes: Trustee’s Blue, Gray,
Holston, Horne, Raczek (5). Motion Carried.

www.Village Of Monee.org



MINUTES FOR MARCH 21, 2018 6:30pPM PAGE 1 OF 2
REGULAR MEETING OF THE PLANNING & ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS

VILLAGE of MONEE “

Will County Illinois

E-3

ROLL CALL

Chairperson Bartlett called the March 21, 2018 Regular Meeting of the Plan Commission and Zoning Board of
Appeals to order at 6:30pm. Commission Members present were: Bartlett, Bugner, Dresback, Dettlaff, Finnen,
Neri (6). Absent: Neiland (1).

OTHERS PRESENT: Administrator Wallace & Deputy Clerk Powell (See list)

APPROVAL OF MINUTES: Minutes of the Regular Meeting of December 20, 2018. Finnen moved,
Bugner seconded to approve the minutes from the Regular Meeting of December 20, 2018. Roll call vote.
Ayes: Bartlett, Bugner, Dettlaff, Dresback, Finnen, Neri (6). Nays: None (0). Absent: Neiland (1). Motion
carried.

PUBLIC HEARING: -Variance Application as Submitted by Paul Sheetz, DC. for the Property Located
at 25646 Governor’s Hwy. Dresback moved, Dettlaff seconded to open the Public Hearing for a Variance
Application as Submitted by Paul Scheetz, DC. for the property located at 25646 Governor’s Hwy. Roll call
vote: Ayes: Bartlett, Bugner, Dettlaff, Dresback, Finnen, Neri (6). Nays: None (0). Absent: Neiland (1).
Motion carried.

Administrator Wallace explained that this is a request from a variance in the Village code which allows for only
one sign in the front of a building. And added that due to an Administrative error the two signs were already
approved and are on the building. Commission member Bugner stated that according to code 12-10C-7 which
allows for additional signage, this request doesn’t need a variance.

Bugner moved, Dresback seconded to close the Public Hearing for a Variance Application as submitted by Paul
Scheetz, DC. for the property located at 25646 Governor’s Hwy. Roll call vote. Ayes: Bartlett, Bugner,
Dettlaff, Dresback, Finnen, Neri (6). Nays: None (0). Absent: Neiland (1). Motion carried.

Bugner moved, Dresback seconded to send a Favorable Recommendation to the Village Board under section
12-10C-7 of the Village code, regarding the Variance Application as submitted by Paul Scheetz, DC., for the
property located 25646 Governor’s Hwy. Roll call vote. Ayes: Bartlett, Bugner, Dettlaff, Dresback, Finnen &
Neri (6). Nays: None (0). Absent: Neiland (1). Motion carried. |

NEW BUSINESS-Application for Consideration of a Minor Subdivision as Submitted by Orchard 2251
LLC. Administrator Wallace had distributed photo’s showing the area/addresses of 25133 & 25153 Ridgeland
and explained that Lot 1 is what would be divided into a minor subdivision. Neri asked what was going to be
done there. Administrator Wallace stated that this is the site of a future commercial development. Bugner
asked if the storm water easement would be dedicated to the Village. Administrator Wallace stated yes.

www.Village Of Monee.org




MINUTES FOR MARCH 21, 2018 6:30pPM PAGE 2 OF 2
REGULAR MEETING OF THE PLANNING & ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS

VILLAGE of MONEE

Will County Illinois M

Bugner moved, Dresback seconded to send a favorable recommendation to the Village Board of Trustee’s for
the Application for consideration of a Minor Subdivision as Submitted by Orchard 2251 LLC. Neri moved to
table this item for more information. Motion to table failed for lack of a second. Roll call vote, on the favorable
motion and second. Ayes: Bartlett, Bugner, Dresback, Dettlaff, Finnen. Nays: None (0). Absent: Nieland
(1). Motion carried.

ADJOURNMENT

Dresback moved, Bugner seconded to adjourn at 6:47 p.m. Roll call vote. Ayes: Bartlett, Bugner, Dettlaff,
Dresback, Finnen, Neri (6). Nays: None (0). Absent: Neiland (1). Motion carried.

“W@M LJ

Michelle Powell, Deputy Village Clerk

www.Village Of Monee.org



VILLAGE of MONEE

Will County Illinois

Mayor
James F. Popp

Village Clerk
Doneshia Codjoe

04/20/2018

Village Deputy Clerk
Michelle Powell

Trustees
Janet Blue
Bill Gray

EZ‘”“:”“’" A Motion was made by Dresback, seconded by Finnen, to send a Favorable
ug Horne

Anthony Raczek Recommendation to the Village Board of Trustees for the Special Use Application as
Submitted by Neil Patterson for the Property Located at 25858 Sunset Dr. Unit 8, to

P&Z Chair allow for a Security Camera System instead off an onsite Security Guard.
Sheila Bartlett

Treasurer
Norbert Snow

S A Vote of four (4) Ayes, None (0) Nay, (2) Absent was taken at the April 18, 2018
David Wallace Regular Meeting.

Police Chief
Scott Koerner

Public Works Superintendent
DJ Kruzel

Finance Director
Darryl Bulliner

Economic Developrment Directorr Mic h e He Powe lf [
Kevin Daly

Deputy Village Clerk
Village Hall
5130 W Court St
Monee, IL 60449
708-534-8301
708-534-6862 fax

Police Departent
5357 W Main St

Monee, IL 60449
708-534-8321 records
708-534-3321 fax

www.Village Of Monee.org




VILLAGE OF MONEE, HLMN@ES
APPLICATION FOR

SPECIAL USE PERMIT A

To: President and Board of Trustees
Village of Monee
5130 W, Court St.
Monee, 1L 60449

Pursuant fo the Village Ordinance, the undersigned files this Applica.tionlfor a Special
Use Permit pursuant to the provisions of the Zoning Ordinances of the Village of Monee,
as amended, and being first duly sworn on oath, deposes and states as follows:

D)o M. Patfeivo
C]?S = ﬂAﬁ ‘/\')/4{-4@( <o “;7‘\"} AGL .

Telephone # FUT36b TAL _ [iv ¢ ede L AATES

2. Name and Address of Applicant ./\,fi(—.?.l - %’“} ‘H‘C’fﬁis o, ! 2. 05‘/&:@
{{not Ouner gﬁafl wlepenta (oo Trus i~ /~08.
e N AT Wlr PReesons
Telephone # £ {/ T 171159"'%;8 G ]374 LOBrG20 L Mo
o OVieeds o BR2eS
If title is held in a land trust, the names, addresses, and interests of all beneficiaries are as |

follows: :
Name : Address _ %

1. Name and Address of Owner

(Add additional information on Rider if more space is needed)



f - o,
Name and Address of Attorney W

of Applicant: M

Telephone # 57~ Tl G 21l J ed. 2 L0Y3E

If Applicant is not the Owner, state interest that the Applicant has in the property:

TR sted S')a,@ﬁ.; Jeme o are TROCT
Foo. Daje W FEpesser
The present Owner has owned the subject property for 20
ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART HEREOF ISA COPYOF A
RECORDED DEED OR OWNERS TITLE EVIDENCING OWNERSHIP OF
THE SUBJECT PROPERTY. :

[

I e L C)

5% 59 Janserbr ed
ST O S T

v cd e B

o ; j o) 8 ood
The tax parcel permanent index nurmber 15t o) = Fo~l O )=

The street address of the propety is:

ali

The legal description of the property involved is as set forth on evidence of title
referred to in Paragraph 5 above, and attached as Exhibit “AR, : |
[ A S B

The present zoniag classification of the subject property is:

The present use of the premise is: A I b VIR e/
PORPENF CUSE. roaesees il ¥ JreA g PQM?L”AJ

10.

I

Set forth specifically the natue of the special use pemit requested and the Zoning
Code Section involved:

by ] . [ F — . b 3
=0 “""’f"d:’ﬁ’%ﬁf‘f@‘% aF &,aesuﬁ (’;5@:.,4,&'

Req ueer
Lise. li:’em{u“a"‘ Cmaol,k_ﬁm&: lic ?3) géc‘aj-ir.u‘;w 3, Lire &l
D * f!. N L . N 3 j ¥ . . i ’) b ~N
e OV Gecufs by ?5@&9:—@%% oS e g.uta{“) ,P;,g,}@ dicd i
vF L - N

Z } ! J._ t H : . - . ]
piguase with | elenifous monivauy, bg A
- . W AN

y . : . =l
S el Y g orpossy: o T
State in detail the reason for the request: ’g GE. Zf 7‘\,15( GJ’{ el




12. The names and addresses of all real estate tax payers of record within 150 feet of

the subject property:
Name Address 7.0ning Classification
E . I - l'a ! ; " i
i wic A \/ At g, /’H’JJM} S D fep M
N T

e “-J
f2a Ve 4 - r
DEE S Rae qg’)aw.%/ Hoe
N erse e bor¥ 9.

@y__(Czige [3eady Mx Ppwce o Tk A

gﬁajﬁsg'f" Sy Jnowpe JL & 213

O 1Agppiose K Jie 360

REg7ZC

NYEC /{';Lg-@ r: j “7}@5@]
)
P oxens, T2 60478

@ e I‘ﬁjec;;}vaa/, ;A ""@/

e 00 Sl DRIVEs

a

Mo joee. T l0F LI




13, State the proposed usc of the premises if special use is grented:

3 .
/\/O a. 2'\ LG T g Ae RREN /L
}33 Bunet LS a8,

14.  Attached hereto is a Plat Plan or accurate drawing indicating the location of the

property and any improvements currently existing thercofl, showing dimensions

and square footage of the parcel of real estate and any improvenjents. {(Need not

be prepared by an engineer unless requested by the Village.)

15, Isnew construction planned for the property? YES___ . NO_;_%L_
Is any remodeling planned for improvements cugrently on the property?
or remodeling is planned,

YES NO 5S¢  ifnew construstion
please supply any available plans thereof.

Dated: 0.5/95/;?5!@.
/

(Individual Owners) (Trustee/Corporate Ownership)

N N I e TR edps
/ MP@%}%@&,@)&J} /éifﬁéﬁfﬁz

o / Type/Print Name

Signatyi® Signature of Aathorized Party
Corporate/Trustee Signature -

ype/Print Name
Aftest:

(Applicant if not Owner)

o
SUBSCRIBED and SWORN TO BY THE ABOVE ownersand Applicant this 23 i

Day of / o/
SAAAAAARAARAARAAPAS ‘
Wmmm public Stata of Floria /7 Notary Public
Cynthia D Blackwood
WMy Commisston G0 149380

‘ gq;%
¥ §
¢ Profad? Einites 1000201



Attachment/#11  Application for Special Use Permit/Dale M Patterson

1. The property currently has installed a state-of-the art security system including
outdoer cameras and motion sensors which has been monitered remetely by Tyeo
Security for the past year and without incident, It provides remote monitored
seeurily 24/7/365 as well as a tape back-up system. This system is currently set up
for remote access by the Monee Police Department and can alse be monitored
remotely by the local property manager and by the owners in Florida.

2. “Personnel on site” stipulated in the current Special Use permit onky provides dusk to
dawn coverage 7 days a week. The view from the working office location only
provides visibility of about 30% of the property as opposed (o the total property
coverage available to the remote security persenmel. If there is activity on the
property the remote security personnel are notified by the motion sensors. On site
personnel would not have this same advantage.

3. Tenants have the property manager’s contact info and already notify her regarding amy
om site problems which arise at any time, The property manager is also the first
point of contact for the security monitoring service; however, the monitoring service
has the ability to contact the police or fire department if they see a situation which
they deem requires this level of intervention.

4. There are inherent difficulties with maivtaining consistent staff for an overnight shift
(high turnover, iilness, bad weather, ne shows, difficully w/holiday coverage) On
site employees cannot be monitored for attentiveness to their job (sleeping,
inappropriate use of the phoune or computer when on shift), These difficulties
increase odds that the property may not be censistently or adequately monitored,
There is also an increased risk & Hability for onsite personnel should an evemt
occur. None of these difficnlties ocour with a remote security company monitoring
system in place.

6. The cost of remote security monitoring is not insignificant; however, when compared to
the costs for a small business in providing on site personnel there is no comparisomn.
This is particularly true when you factor in the much improved performance and
quality of moniforing provided by the security menitoring compamny.

In summary, the remote security monitoring with the state-of-the-art system currently
instailed more than meets the securily needs of the property and provides much improved
and consistent momitoring wien compared to on site personmel.



&3 ,\j\rh? {7
s " . s -
CEL TITLR NSURANDY 53&:&, Y
N POLICY ff 295G

OLICE NO.: 141 SOIRE7503 we

DATE OF POLYCY: APRIL

AWQUNT OF DSURANCE:

LOAN WUMBER:

TOUR LOAN RIFEREWCE:

L. NAME OF INSUHED:

2; 2002

$140,900.00

PRI L
S

%
JUDY/PATTERSON/ 25836 SUNSET SR, MONEE, TL

il

FIRST MIDVWEST BANZ

2. THE SOTATR OR INTSRSST IN THE L4ND DESCRIBED 1M THIS SCHEDULE AND WHICH IS
SWNCUMBERED BY THA INSURED MORTEAGE OR TRUST DESD TS 4 8k SINPLE, UNLESS
OTHERWISE NOTED,

3. TITLE TO THE FSTATE OR INTSREST T THE LAND T sUESTES 1N

.’ DALE PATTERSON ENTERPRTSES, TWC. AN TLLINOLS CHORPORATION

‘ &

i ;

4. THE TWSORED MORTGAGE OR TRUST DRED, AND AsSTGmmM;s THEREQF, IF ANY, ARE
DESCRIBED AS FOLLOUS: 5
MORTGAGE DATRD MARCH 22, 2002 AND RECORDED APRIL 2, 2002 A§ DOCUMENT R2002-55843
MADE BY DRLE PATTERSON EVTERPRISES, DMC, TO FIRST MIDFEST BANX T0 SECURE A MORTGAGE
FOR $140,000.00.
wHEY POLICY VALED CNTY X7 SCREDULE B IS ATTACHED
TEHEAIDE o

!n)
e
L
19
&l

X
4]

JOR 05/04/02



ol

el Y
) TETLE @fsm@xm COME
LOAN POLICY (1592)

SCHEDULE 4 gﬁ@iﬁ*fﬁrjﬁ D}

4 POLLCY MO.:

s OOTSB7E03 we

LOT 1 TW MIDWESTHERW SOBDIVISION,
1/4 OF SECTION 2¢., TOWNSHIP 34 NORTH, RANGE 13,

MERIDIAN,

RB5-21144,

E)

LEND REFERRED TO 1N THIS PODLICY IS DESCRIBED AS FOLIOUS:

BETNG A PART OF THE FAST 1/2 OF THE NORTHHEST

P

RASY 0F THE THIRD PRINCIPAL

ACCORDING TO THE PLAT TEEREOF 'QECOR'DH) JUET 8, 1985 AS DOCUMENT NO.

iN WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS.

ok

i M i T

=

T b

.,,,,,..
- .1.-"{:;‘ o
%

¢

| mETE RPOLICY YALTD Gsﬁi&"‘ P g:ﬁ@'ﬁ?ﬁ? 3 19 RETACHED.

TFOLAR

: J08

g5/04702



<0 TITLE NGB ANTH | :}BfP.:—_. i

R .n-.

G

CNATURE PAGE

' porzey mo. : 1410 DOISE7E03_ we

Y SHALY MOT

' BE VALTD OR BIWDING UNTIL SIicwsDp Y AW AUTHORIZED SICHATORY.

CHICAGO TITLE INSURANCE COMPATTY

i LA

/el Lol Sllnidres
7 fg't';rgm{ﬁm qcﬁ@ﬂm’ 71

m
e
-

]

PRt

e,

a

o108 psioa/fo2 10:53:34




(o~ the fizst pars, and
L ‘

47~ _ygle Paitersen

P O 1
e Ay ,;\-‘5:’
Mferprises. ine. _ —
whose addrasis . 22836 Sunset Drive West, Monee, Illingis [FRA I

1000 Sunset Drive West, Moneea.

1L, 66449

pany of thesccond part.

Dreser

WITHESSETH,

That said paniy of the firsi part, in consideration of the sum of Ten and Noj190 (316.08) Gollaws

and other good and valuable considerations in hand paid. docs heteby grant, sdl and comver unto s8d pariy of the secondd

poart, the following described real estate, sitnated inyfige)

LG“ 1
HOXR ig
l%Tl:U
8, 1835 Ab

BiN: 14-20-100-0

191

c County, Hlinols, in-wit:

BEING A PART OF THEE
SHIP 34 NORTH, RANG
ik PLS }r“

0L F i

M SUBJ“’;SLUN
EC;mg' 20, TOWH

RIDLAN, n(,co’UImG ™ T
P 18521154, IN WILL COUNTY,

13-9060 Q‘}S

THE
ORDED JULY

w4

Z21

r-J I.TJ

COMMON ADDRESS: 1000 SUNSET DRIVE WEST - MONEE,IL 50449 wxa
25336 Sunset Drive West, Monee, 1llincis
'r"'"f’i
GHTRLEY R, RUSTR .
wiLL CGU(‘HY QECUPDL\-R ®
K
.
i]ij
= — e . TR oo o -
}é = fENEE ‘:“--‘,."Q; ERS AN
‘—'ﬁ; LN, REELT AT AT
ST e ¥ W
A - AT ; .
4 N R B S N I
fry  _ esoden {RE /it =
Al

together with the tenements and appunicnances thereanto belonging.

TO HAVE AND TO BOLD the same unio said party of the second part, and to the proper use, benefit and behool

forever of sald party of the secand parnt.

This deed is cxceuted pursuant to and m the vxerase of the power aid authorin granted w and vested in'said

trustee by the terms of said deed or deeds in tiust dehvered to said trustee in puinuance of the trust agreement above men-
tioned. This deed is made subject 1o the liem of every trust deed or montsage Wi there bed of record insaid county ghoen

to secure the payment of money, and remuniag unreleased at the date of detreery hereall

'u:d fras

IN WITNESS WHERECFE. sadl party of the rmé;‘iij t{l 15 uu df%
caused its nome to be signed o these presenis by its Lispgiag a.-x m\_m

the dav and vear first ab

This instrument prepared by

ho YR N G [

corporaie sed to be hq,g‘tu .g_l
o‘ag‘md atwsied Iy ats m ,::m

STANDARDANK AND TRUST COMPANY
As lruster as al’urcsa:d
..,/ \ //

S

ChGE

ove wWhilen,

B Ay
s £ 1 (7 1S
I L L P
(;‘_":"; : - By 4..\?___ L) -.-!}Ar-.. Wﬁ:}”‘}\
B - - TRECRI. KRR R‘?’ SR



Lyl

0TS

/ ~

0L 8

4

OELLNWHS AGDHH

: INIWESYS NOLLNDEIU GNY

..... ARG T WGG.05.88 N

m 3.596.9G.83MN
L L0 S0-UINUCO LOVIHINON b 1040 SN LOTHIHON

ONINNIDEE 40 INICd

0000-SL0-004-02-Vi-LZ N1

SST YO IO "0V F50°L “1I0S TLE'SE DMNINIYLNG:

: o . . "SIONITH“ALNNOD TUAA NI TV @szgmﬁg JO ANIOd IHL OL L334 Le'CEY 30 IONYLSION
L8¥3 SANOTZS 59 SALNNIN 96 SIIYDHICA $8 HLKMON INIT HLHON GIVS DNGCIVY ZIONIHL L 10T J0 INIT HLHON SHL OL 1333 62°02t JO FONYLSY

¥ LS3IM SONODIS 1€ SALONMWY 77 SIALDIA 00 HLBON TN LSTM IHL SNOTV IONTHL °L LOT 0 INET LOT ASIM IHL OL LT3 2 9ig 4
IONYLSIA ¥ LSIM SANODHS 58 STLMMNI 95 STIHDIA 98 HLNOS IONIHL (1334 00708 IO IONVISIO ¥V LSIM STNODIS 82 STUNNIN €4 STTHO
€0 FINOS JONIHL ~1333 00871 O JONVLSIO ¥ 1S3 SONOIIS 5S STLNNIN 95 STIHHAA 98 HINOS JONSZHL 11534 00°08 40 IONYLS

¥ LSV SUONQOIS 82 SALNNIA €1 STIUOIA 20 HLKMON IONTHL 1334 12'99 4O IDNVISIA ¥ 1SIM SANODIS SC SILANIA 08 SIIHDIA 82 WA

INTT AiYS DNLIEYEET SONIHL - 1339 00°£2% 30 IONVLSIA V LS3IM STNOOIS 92 STLONIN €1 SIIHDEA ZOHLNOS ‘L L0720 INET LOT 1SV !

ONIZE OSW LSIM SANMCT [ISNNS 0 INIT AVM=IO-1HDIY 18T/ JHL ONOTY IONIHL ‘L 1O QVS H0 YANEOD ISVIHIHON JHL LY ONINMIC: |

SMOTIOS 8Y a0

\ _ : , . SIoNITN TALNNOOTHAM NI ‘POLLS-GBY LINTIAS:
@% mwmm.@%.ﬁﬂ@w@i@@mzm@mimfb.__.i&miﬁ@%@%@i@@@@,Zggmmmﬁéﬂe_.@zmi&_Q%i&. Q‘Z.H_.m_O.wrwﬁmmwuﬂ@z%@.faﬁﬁuz.@m%ingﬁ

02 NOILLOZIS 40 HI1HVYND LSHAMHILON IHL 40 40 STWH LSV IHL 40 1MV v ONIZE ‘NOISIAIGENS NUZLSIAMGIN Ni 1 LOT 40 Ldvd ONE
JINOW G SOV IA SHL OL NOLLNZ L34 OGNV SOVNIVYC J30VAM WHOLS HO-




. R i g T TSmO M M e ng WMy | e BTN OO JOT om et E 3 X0,
L. TURY 2 P vy e 7 % BT ERIEe ey = FEVIYITIYSTAS puw ShUTMReIy Suinyon
. PV Enewearebyg pow TRIEPELS FYDUTETR ‘oouon Fo 2PRIIFA 02 wSUTGXOISS 107 perpews usey seq aerd 5TYL

x4
- - - . : . TEACRJEY DRISTINIoNS
smoy A -
oy - 3 K
o . 5
stes]
jireac
g % FPegre-OE voproeg o BIT JROLLION SO ST ypnvs | .
. r B . et . ' ] . Lq _mha.ua
. IV\P . -wl,n)q—» P P
. ?l%fr..fi.}..,:l..ﬁ.. L s SO o // G
. L a4 - : R e -
® g : , i -} : ir G T . ’
N CEN SN S P .
g @.ﬁ m ) T i s Lty éol...l.lﬁ.«...l.lnlrf DLGr a2 T
. B e G I O Dhee-@Ry gy o g
e .f_r.r 2 % o TS, 2 LTINS LI, P BT 7 e
) S . e FEWIRNE TLrOAIes [ ProROS kg o Y
iy %\  RRARITRAY PO TGt RS D 2 - o
g i B E . S 5
7 T h £y = -
! o] . ;SM.. : ..!.LN v 3 =
N t = k1)
. L m_ i o
Foo Bl u - T
o R A v Sy 2
B o : 3 sl = 2
I & - . u.mw..“ - Hﬁ f,‘&m ' . i . muw ~u
RS .é. :° . ) .W/wm . . b . :\M.V. ..miw :
: B P ] - Gy =1 -
N o | P \ e .
af AT §LOT - 5
o v A s
od i oL : X
= i o R RRUIE .. = - )
- e B n..u..u.m‘w - o e n.m o M
o FOR__RW S - - e
T S Z -
wx @fm NS 0 3.&% p 5
,zw D P S . . -3 & e
RO W AR - o= -
e * % 1 TR Es . . xR
. T % g o Loasa’ o
s, .. A‘_ Wm} | . % u.m..w, x, -
o N A B Mﬁ,.. S Qi =te - e -
m ol I 1 S AR R o B
5 - T - B . " ey
. Rl oy ol FEOT WOIRS 0 /1 35omyroopy g
g T 0 F e oY piein geng o FYF Lo -
. I s v . - P . ot i .
. “. oy 3 . - . [ -
s . A
N
- : g
Lt Rl PR
e : ! & -
— \ . i n
3 L - % " - i } '
’ % - . |...q 2
. ) Lo R 1o
. "
LT . . o v e
- . - e

FEG e

s
PRI gl

1






» Goneral Ratas

» Baataves:

PIRAMITY X1.2 models BDI-76X12 and
SDI-7YXLR are dual technology intrusion
sensors combining proprietary Sterec
Doppler Microwaye Technology with &
dual slemenst Passive Infrared Sensor The
independent sensor technologies must
activate simultaneously to create an
overall sensor alarm.

The XL8 version incorporates advanced
signal processing for enhanced bird and
anitnal frmunity. The PIRAMID X1,8 sen-
sors are unigue in that they provide reliable
outdoor volumetric protection under
even the most severe environmental
conditions.

- Steveo Doppler Microwave Detector -
Two receiving channels eltminate
vibration and moving objects as sources
of false alarms.

- Dual Element Infrared Detector -
Ignores normal termperature variations
yet is responsive to infrared changes
created by an inkruder.

- Microprocessor Controlled - Enhanced
digital signal processing for microwave
and passive infrared technologies.

- Balanced Temperature Compensation
Dual technology automatically adjusts
detsction parameters to compensate for
the losg of range that cocurs at elavated
temperatures.

- Stereo Doppler Supervision - A com-
ponent or power fatlure will cause
sensor to lock in alarm.

- Digital Bange Gontrol - Ten-position
digital switch adjusts the size of the
sensor's detection area.

PIRAMID X2 Outdoor Motion Sensor
Models BDL-TEXLS, BDI-V7ELA

PIRAMD

- Digital Sensitivity Gontrol - Ten-
pogition digital switeh adjusts the
amount of movement reguired to initi-
ate an alarmn condition,

- Emhanced Bird/Animal Inmunity -
Two-position switch adjusts the sensor’s
imnunity to birds and small animals,

- Master Alarm LED -Displayed on the
face of the unif indicating the alarm
relay status.

- tWalikc-Test Bounder - Optional audible
tester to assist in the walk-test and
initial sengor set-up.

- Swivel Mounting -180° Horizontal Ad-
justment and 90°Vertical Adjustment.

- Tamper Proof-Houging

- Al BoliQ State Relay - More reliable
than an electromechanical relay.

- RMietal Housing - Rugded, weather-proof
housing offers maxivaur protection.

- Weather Shroud - Metal hood that
routes rain away from sensor’s face and
provides protection from ice, snow,
wind and sun loading.

P.0. Box 401 Southampton PA 18966 Phone: (218) 938-1980  Fax: (R15) 938-1484
General info@perimsys.com | Dealers sales@perimsys.corm | Government fad@perimsys.com

Copyright © 2014, Perimeter Protection Systems | Web Site By Pliner Solutions, Ina.




Featpt'es_frhat Make & Difference:

‘o Supe or towy light performance .
=  Face ﬂetecticn a.r'u.d blur (_j_eteciioré

°  3and 8 megapixel r_esolut.ions

e Qufc}_( angt easy installation and
conf_i__gu_ration

s One-touth focus and matorized zoom

’ o Multipte motorized lens optioné_
s Reduced storage cost with H.264
- and integrated region of interest {RON)
bandwidth meahageiment analytics-

= Upto fivé individual programmable
© regions of interest.

o True WDR in 3MP Mini-Dome options

s IPBG and IK10 ratings

b

uets

The lilustra Pro 1P Mini-Domes provide ¢sp
and clear high-definition video, at full rame
raies, Whethar in bright sun, near darkness
or blackout conditions, you can clearly sse
important detafls, such as license plates,
merchandise fabels, and faces.

installation is simple and sasy with no
additional cost or hardware. The cameras
include various integrated mounting options
including hard surface and electric box. On
indoor cameras, a plenum cap is included
as well as mounting clips for recessed flush
instaltation. Configuration is simplified using
the mast comron web browsers to access
the browser-based camera fnterface for

matorized zoom. Nustra Connect, a powerful
remote management ang conligoration
software lool, makes set up and installation
even easier,

Using onboard motior-detection, and
advanced, inteqrated analytics, the Hustra
Pra Mini-Domes reduge your engoing cost of
gperation by ninirmizing the cost of storage
while ensuring image quality, The P66 and
110 rated ouidoor Mini-Domes are rugged
and durable providing a vandal resistant
enclosure, water ingress protection, and dust
ingress protection, The Miri-Domeas can be
powered using PoE or 24Vac. The autdoor
Mini-Dome can operate in temperatures as

feature control including one-touch focus and - low as -40°C when nowered using 24vac,




tVideo Compression | H.264, MJPEG

H.264, MJPEG

 Max Frame Rale BMP T 5P kIt -5MP
Aprirtary Sisasrs) ! . : o - ; . : : o
i He4 2048x15368301ps 2502%1944@15s | E 2048153623015 2592319441578 -
o MIPEG f 102014208200 = 192014408 15%ps U ToReH40850fs. 19201144001 50Ds :
; ONVIF-Complian ‘Yas Vs
§ Anedogue Vidéo Output © . 1.0 Vp-n, BNG pigtall ineiuded . 1.0¥p-p, BNG pigtad inchuded :
;Resoiution R e ) 3MP and SMP_ o . R
; {2048x1536) QXA 43 " (1920x1086) 1080p 169 T i7hekETg) 43 [GaR  4:3 :
H : (1920x1440) 4:3 (1280x720) 720p 16:9 {BA0XABH B0 VBA 43 1384216} 16:9
: {1600x1200) UXGA 4:3 (024763 1024 XGA 43 (640+350; nHD 16:0
L [1280x360) SXGA _ {1024x578) PAL»_16:9 P dsoae0rded 43 e
; N N S0P {and all resolutians listed above) o
: ) ‘ B (2592x1944) "4 T
1limrager 143.2° GMOS progressive scan 1/3.5" CMOS progressive scan :
 Day/Night Yas Yes
IR {ﬁu'nfnahon Opuma! Yas Yes .
: Motion Deigction Yeg Yo5 :
}FaceQe'taduon Yo ; Yes ) :
¢ Privacy Zones Yas : Yes ;
Bt 1O - P : 241 :
. Video Slreams 3 streams plus analog out : 3 shrgams plus analog ot
Minbrofrlumination |, SMP39mm ] BMPS-22mm | 5MP3-9mm | BMP 0-22mmy ce © 39mm :
Golot” 0.05 S0Ghk | 08k Gtk . 03k :
BAW {0 0008lx L 0004l L DOR 003 T Q02w ' .
PwirL - o : T . CDChx {
Dynamic Range 3MIP: TWDR S8d3 3P TWIOR 9608 :
: SMP: WDR 9003 SP; WOR ¢0UB !
Rl of View (V) - o 3amm - o 9-22mm &amm :
Wide Angle BRY/64° : 8. BE/64”
Telaphots a0e2° 1209+ 20%23°

niertace : Ethernet 10/1008e06-TX
*Ethernet Port : RJ-45 -
: Supported Protecols | TGRAR, 1Py, IPv6, TOP, UDF, I TF, FT, DHOR, WS-Discovery,

T 16, 11.'F'E'.fe'fcx, Chreme

NS, DDNS, RTP, TLS, Unicast, Mutticast, NTH, SMTR, WS-Geou

doatorized varifocal

themet 107 IOOBase‘TX :
: Rd-45 . L
‘TCP!IP 1Pva, |8, lCP UDP, HTEPR, FTR DHCR WS Duscovery ONS, DDNS

f RTP, TLS, Unicast. Mudticagt, NTFR, SMTP, WS-Becuri

15 10 11 Firafox, r‘nrcme .

Niliti-evis, 1P address fliertag, HTTPS, User sccoss log, IEEE 802.1x

Zbarﬁ uS,msn L

3”GBy1es and SOXC ug'fo 1 9BGE!ytes
Yes
A

\ia browser L.sng FIp

Pre alann Recording
Reccra’ ing Férmat
,;Play’nack
 Recording Trigger

4VAC PoE 1EFE 802.3af Class 3
12.95W

sl?

| [)1mens|ms (le-n . 130x 138 mm 612x5.43 inJ
2--Weigl‘i‘:- ! 1 i (2,20 fos)

{ Housing Color i WWhite or black

O{.)G"n‘il[lg Tempexauue ; 0% e 40°C {14° 1o 104°F)

H

{ + Vandaf Resistant RIG
Hontdoor Rzmng i N/A
L Yor

lass .

N 55022 Class A; FOG Part 15

: Emis;.;lons 4 i
: IGES-DXI/MMB-003 Class A; AS/MNZS GISPR 22 c,tass A o
Irarmwinity : EN B03G0-4; ENSEO24 -

‘Safaty N GOSA0-1; UL 69501

L 8A22.2MNo 609501 IEC 09801

Standard SD o nat up to 4GB, SOHG format up te

- Stadciard 50 format up to 4G, SOHC format up 1o

T 3pGByek ang SDXC vt lo 128GByles : Sy

es
Al
Vig rowser using FTP
Lrycortact alarms, motion dateption, face

24VAC, PoE IEEE B02.3af Gfass 3
2.05W

! o 135 160 mm (5.31 x8.30 1)
} _ 1859 38T Ibe}

: White or black i

; o “POE; -30° to 50°C-(-22° 10.122°F) e

24VAC: -40° 10 50°C (-40° o 122°F) IR

16 ) :

P65

N/A

EN 55022 Ulass A FCC Part 15 Class A;
ICES-DOZMNMB-003 Class A; AS/NZS GISPR 22 Glass A
. | EN50120-4; ENGS024
: EN 60950-1; UL 80950-1
CSA.22.2 by, B0950-1; 1EC 80950




VISTA-128BP SERIES

PARTITIONED COMMERCIAL BURGLARY ALARM CONTROL PANELS

ADDITIONAL FEATURES

Basic Hardwired Zones

Provides nine style-B hardwired zones
with the following characteristics:

= EQOLR supervision [optional for zones
2-8) supporting N.G. or N.C. sensors
{EOLR supervision required for fire
and UL burglary installations)

+ Indivicdually assignable to one of
eight partitions

Polling Loop Expansicn

Supporis up to 119 additional zonss
using a buiit-in polling {V-Plex, multiplex)
loop interface. Current draw can tofal
up to 128mA. Falling !oop zones have
the following characteristics:

= Must use V-Plex devices

o Supervised by control panel

s [ndividually assignable to one of
eight partitions

Wireless Expansion

Supports up to 127 wireless zones

using up ta two 5800 series wireless

recelvers {fower if using hardwire

and/or polling foop zones).

Wireless zones have the foliowing

characteristics:

* Supervised by control panel for
check-in sighals (except certain
non-supervised transmitiers)

¢ Tamper proteciion for supervised
transmitters

» Individuaily assignable to onc of
cight partitions

Scheduling

Provides the following scheduting

capabilities:

= Open/close schedules (for contiol of
arming/disarming and reporting}

« Holiday schedules {allows different
fime windows for openiclose

chedules}

= Timed events (for activation of relays,
auto-bypassing and unbypassing,
auto-arming and disarming. efc.)

« Access schedules {for limiting system
access to users hy ime}

= End user output programming mode
{provides 20 timers for output control;

Eight Partitions

Provides the ahility to controf sight
separate areas independently, each
functioning as if it had iis own separale
control. Partiioning features inchude:

= A Common Lobby parlilion (1-8),
which can be programmed fo arm
automaticalty when the last partition
that shares the common lobby is
armed, and to disarm when the firsi
partition that shares the common
labby is disarmed

s A Master pariition (9), used slrictly to
assign keypads for (he purposs of
viewing the status of alt eight partitions
at the same time (master keypads)

= Al zones assignable fo one of
clght parlitions

= Keypads assignable to one of eight
partiions or to Master partition 9 to
view system staius

= Ability to assign relays to one or all
eight partitions

* Ability to display fire and/or burgiary
and panlc and/ar trouble conditions
at a¥ other partitions' keypads
{selectable option)

o Individually programmable account
number, entry delay and exit delay by
pariiticn

015N DT25003n
Relay Module V-Plex DUAL TEC
Motion Senser

Paralal Printer

Alpna Paging
Mogulﬂ

FG16238N Glasskbreak

R3-232

Mra\}‘

A2933IN Adaplérs

42084 Eight-zone
Exparsion Module and
4208EX Eight-zone
V-Plag Expandar

Hotification
Appliances

V-Plex Loop

ECP Bus

T 5881
L \Wirsless
1 Rocelver

6160

Coisgly

S

HaSM

NOTE: Please refer fo the websife (www.honeywell.comyisecurityrhsc) for the lalest product information.

32 Phone Line to Central Stalion



e : %hsms?_ﬁ\
.‘— ‘8 S
: e
oy

i

ER i R i S e B

516.46° M (516.45' R)

NDO’M‘ 31 nw

\‘- -
o ‘f\;(:;,;;:, \gy&"msﬁﬁl‘: /CD rals o

/
f

g (amens joc.trors




BT ST FRLA TR

Cgimnuen € o Beip

LAMBLR FITG SPEY

i
i
|
{

g P

g BBUG R B




Will County linois

ORDINANCE NUMBER 1673

AN ORDINANCE APPROVING THE ISSUANCE OF A SPECIAL USE
PERMIT ON BEHALF OF NEIL A. PATTERSON AS LEGAL GUARDIAN
OF DALE M. PATTERSON WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOME

RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES
OF THE VILLAGE OF MONEE

THIS _8TH DAY OF January , 2014

Published in Pamphiet Form by Authority of the
Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee,
Will County, Illinois,

This _8th day of January, 2014

Special Use Ordinance - Pattersen as Legal Guardian of Dale M. Patterson Page 1of 5



3
37
38

39
40

#
42
43
44
45

46
47

48

49
50

51
52

53

54

85
5

57
58

58
60

61
62

63
54

85
66

NOW, THEREFORE, BE 1T ORDAINED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees
of the Village of Monee, a Home Rule Unit of Government, Will County, Illinois,
as follows:

Section One—Preambles. That the preambles above set forth are
incorporated herein as if set forth in full.

Section Two—Special Use Permit. That the request of the Applicant for the
issuance of a special use permit allowing for outdoor truck storage parking in
not more than Fifty-Eight (58) parking lanes within a secured paved parking
area as delineated in the Application along with outside storage of tenant
vehicles and equipment is hereby approved.

Section Three—Conditions, That this special use permit is strictly
conditioned upon the following:

o Overnight idling of any tractor trailer vehicle shall be prohibited;

o The parking of tractor trailers shall be limited to the lot area located
behind the front building line of the existing building;

o The tractor trailers parked at this site shall all be in operating condition
and no repairs shall take place on the lot;

o Abandoned vehicles of any kind will not be permitted to park on this
site;

o The site will be fenced in accordance with the applicable provisions of
the Village Code;

o Qutdoor storage of tenant vehicles and equipment shall be limited to the
lot area located behind the front building line of the existing building;

o Installation of security cameras which shall be remotely accessible to the
Monee Police Department;

o Premises will have security personnel on site from dusk to dawn seven
days a week; and

o Non-trailered storage containers will be prohibited from parking at the
site.

Section Four—Repealer. That all Ordinances or parts of Ordinances in
conflict herewith are expressly repealed.

Special Use Ordinance - Patterson as Legal Guardian of Dale M. Patlerscn Page 3of 5



ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE APPROVING THE ISSUANCE OF A SPECIAL USE
PERMIT ON BEHALF OF NEIL A. PATTERSON AS LEGAL GUARDIAN
OF DALE M. PATTERSON WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOMIE

RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

AYES: NAYS: ABSTAILRN: ABSENT: PRESENT:
Gonzalez
Gray
Horne
Holston

Popp
Raczek

PASSED and APPROVED this 8th  day of January ; 2014,

2

Iy F@/quhar Vlllage Mayor.

i L

ATTEST: ’/{\ rgf ,v’/’ i\,l"‘"q& ‘\ \-
Wayne Haser, V|Ilage Clerk

Special Use Ordinance - Patterson as Legal Guardian of Dale M. Patterson Page50of 5



YVILLAGE of MONEE

Will County Hlinois

Mayor
James F. Popp

Village Clerk
Doneshia Codjoe

04/20/2018

Village Depury Clerk
VMichelle Powelf

Trustees

Janet Blue

Bill Gray

David Holston A Motion was made by Dresback, seconded by Finnen, to send a Favorable

Doug Horne .
Anthony Raczek Recommendation to the Village Board of Trustees for the Notice of Development for a

Community Solar Garden

PE&Z Chair
Sheila Bartlett

Treasurer
Norbert Snow

Administrator A Vote of four (4) Ayes, None (0} Nay, (2) Absent was taken at the April 18, 2018
David Wallace
Regular Meeting.
Police Chief
Scott Koemer

Public Works Superintendent
DI Kruzei

Finance Director
Darryl Bulliner

Economic Development Directorr

Kevin Daly Michelle Powell
Village Hall Deputy Village Clerk
5130 W Court St
Monee, IL 60449
708-534-8301
708-534-6862 fax

Police Department
5357 W Main St

Monee, IL 60449
708-534-8321 records
708-534-3321 fax

www.Yillage Of Monee.ory




i
C‘x\ a ﬁ . 4849 Rugby Avenue

SOmimuni Bethesda, b 20814
POWER GROUP y Phone, 844-265.6088

April 4%, 2018

Village of Monee
5130 W Court Street
Monee, IL 60449

RE: Motice of Development for Community Solar Garden
To Whom It May Concern,

This letter is to provide notice of development for a community solar garden within 1.5mi of the
Viliage of Monee. Community Power Group is working to develop the community solar garden,
Monee Sun |, on approximately 20 acres on the corner of Governors Highway and W Offner Road,
south of Monee, See the attached map for further details on the location and the attached site
plan for details on the solar farm.

If you have any questions or thoughts, please feel free to reach out to me by phone at (443) 878-
8296 or by e-mail at nmento@communitypowergroup.com.

Best regards,

Nick Mento
Project Manager

© Community Power Group 2017



. Exhibit A — Project Location




SYSTEM SULMARY

P E

MEOOULE DUYPLT: 353 W
MODULE COLUNT. 7,837
8TENG SRE T7
SLWBEP. OF STRINGS: 201

FANUFSTTIAES: HAKWHR Q{HIS
T00YLE MOTEL DALUS 162345

IVCTEY CUTPUT: 2720 665 0W DL

IEETER:
EENUSLSTIRER: SUNSRIAL
ISVERTIR MGREL SOEHY

PATING: 126

BT 15
TC SYETEA VOLTARE 1530
JETTEN CUTPUT: 2000 WY AC
DS ACSRATIE: 135

RAGKING
FAHUFECSTURER: GANECHANGE
G 2780
FOUNDATIRN: DRWEN POST
CONFIGURATION: 1
REINUTE 1E0r
UCTDR GUANTITY: 07
FEDDULED PER TRACKER: 61
POIT QRRMIITY: 9D

Box
TRANSFURRER PATNG: WA
TRANIFQRIFER OTY: 1
SNTERDON. VDLTARE 1260
HATNEIZES: TNGLE
£ P3 ARTRINGTS 1200 4T

ARFROX TOLE SADE OR B2e o
AT +10ATRAY £ SR

Exhibit B - Site Plan

M+W GROUP
M+ Encrey,

Inc.

am

S WML W, D SRt

=L

3 *raimran, O Cenpt meskis

fppmrirt 3 Samruts

GROUP

.
W

ER

n\.\}

0

N
P
=2
MC..
EEREY]
=l
= &
Lo S
bt

0
L
I

g

A

i

24
Hwy, MOMEE, IL

T
LaYouT

[Feem . 162

LT




Nick Mento from Community Power Group was contacted with a few questions. The questions
and answers are provided below.

From: David Wallace <dwaliace ®villageofmonee.org>
Sent: Monday, April 16, 2018 12:09:55 PM

To: Nick Mento

Subject: Monee Project

Mr. Mento,
The village is in receipt notifying us of your propose project. Just a few questions:

o s Community Power Group a for profit company
o What is the intended use of the power being generated? Sold to the grid {(power company)?

e  How tall are the solar panels?
o Will the panels be visible from IL 50?

Please provide answers to these questions along with any additional information you may wish to

provide.
Do you plan to have a representative at our Planning and Zoning meeting on Wednesday 4/18 @

630pm?

A response today before 2pm would be appreciated as our meeting packet must be completed.

Thank you,

Dawid Wallace
Administrator
Village of Monee
5130 W, Court Street
Monee, [[. 60440
(708) 534-8307

ANSWERS

1. Community Power Group is a for-profit company.

2. The community solar garden is part of a utility-led program that will allow local electric
customers to subscribe to the facility to receive energy "credits”. They will effectively
receive the energy from the solar facility by purchasing these credits for which they will
purchase at a lower rate compared to their traditional energy cost. The result is cheaper
electric from a clean source. While the energy technically goes to the grid, local
residents and businesses will be receiving the benefit.



3. Panels are instailed on steel poles in the ground and at their highest could reach about
8-10' from ground level.

4. Partof the northwest border of the property has existing vegetation screening the
highway. However additional landscaping will be utilized {evergreen trees and/or
shrubs) that will effectively provide screening per Wil County's ordinances.

Feel free to let me know if you have any further guestions and| icok forward to hearing back on
my last e-mail regarding the meeting.

Thank you,

Nick

Nick Mento

Project Manager
Community Power Group
{0) 202-844-6423

(c) 443-878-8296

NMEnio@comimunitypowergroun.com

WWW.COMIM Uity poOWergroup.com




SYS DATE:04/19/18

Village of Monee

SYS TIME:15:58

CLAIM SHEET NCS]
DATE: 04/19/18 Thursday April 19, 2018 PAGE 1
VENDOR # NAME DEPT. AMOUNT
01 CORPORATE FUND
ANCEL ANCEL GLINK DIAMOND 01-00 2,475.00
GASCT PINKERTON OIL/GAS CITY 01-00 2,591.40
GTSAC GTSAC INC, 01-00 455,00
L0726 TEAMSTERS LOCAL 700 01-00 1,241.00
MAILF MATLFINANCE 01-00 267.60
NCPER NCPERS GROUP LIFE INS. 01-00 304.00
SouT1 SOUTH SUBURBAN MAYORS & MNGR.  0I1-00 100.00
STERL STERLING CODIFIERS, INC. 01-00 1,237.00
TE TYSON ENGINEERING 01-00 648.25
TRIBB TRIBUNE MEDIA GROUP 01-00 106.58
TROFI DANIEL TROFIMCHUK 01-00 5.00
WALTO WALTON OFFICE SUPPLY 01-00 199.44
TOTAL " 9,630.27
COMCA COMCAST CABLE 01-21 124.85
CULLT CULLIGAN WATER CONDITIONING 01-21 96.73
DIGIT DIGITAL-ALLY, INC. (1-21 4,025.00
FEDEX FEDEX 01-21 96.44
FORES FOREST SOUTH ANIMAL HOSPITAL 01-21 100.35
IFPE ILLINOIS FIRE & POLICE EQUIP. 01-21 1,646.00
NAPA NAPA AUTO PARTS MONEE 01-21 119.93
RWK RWK IT SERVICES 01-21 2,250.00
TCGRS THE COMPOUND GUN REPATR SHOP, LTD01-21 1,450.00
WEX WEX BANK 01-21 17.39
*STOTAL 3,976.69
BOUND BOUND TREE MEDICAL LLC 01-22 712.96
CINTS CINTAS CORPORATION #319 01-22 1,246.78
CULLI CULLIGAN WATER CONDITIONING 01-22 36.07
INTEL INTERSTATE BATTERY OF CHICAGO  (01-22 2,526.80
MENAR MERARDS 01-22 374.89
RAINB RAINBOW FARMS ENTERPRISES, INC 01-22 131.50
SAMS SAM'S CLUB 01-22 388.40
TE TYSON ENGINEERING 01-22 1,416.25
*HTOTAL 7,333.60
TE TYSON ENGINEERING 01-61 651.00
*ATOTAL 651.00
CCALL CHRISTINE CALLARD 01-70 60,00
FARIA PETER FARIAS 01-70 50.00
WASHG GLOVER WASHINGTON 01-70 60.00
*RTOTAL 170,00
01 CORPORATE FUND GRAND TOTAL  27,711.56
ADVAP ADVANCE AUTQ PARTS 02-00 179.26
CINTS CINTAS, CORPORATION #319 02-00 118.24
MTE MONRQE TRUCK EQUIPMENT INC 02-00 501.41
PERFC PERFORMANCE COATING, INC 02-00 125.00
REDWI RED WING 02-00 300.00
SHORE SHOREWOOD HOME & AUTO INC 02-00 58.02
STATE STATE OF ILLINOIS 02-00 136,523.88
TE TYSON ENGINEERING 02-00 3,140.25
TERRY TERRY'S FORD, LINCOLN-MERCURY — 02-00 79.95
*RTOTAL 141,026.01
02 ROAD & BRIOGE GRAND TOTAL 141,026.01

E-G



SYS DATE:(4,/19/18 Village of Monee

SYS TIME:15:58

CLAIM SHEET [NCS]
DATE: 04/19/18 Thursday april 19, 2018 PAGE 2
VENDOR # NAME DEPT. AMOUNT
03 MFT
COMPA COMPASS MINERALS AMERICA 03-00 3,386.08
*ETOTAL ©3,386.08
03 MFT GRAND TOTAL  3,386.08
ADVAP ADVANCE ALTO PARTS 05-00 44,69
COMCA COMCAST CABLE 05-00 189. 85
INTEL TNTERSTATE BATTERY OF CHICAGO  05-00 400,00
*ETOTAL 634?3&—
05 £SDA GRAND TOTAL 634.54
CHIEF CHIEF SUPPLY/LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPOR-00 5,092.81
CINTS CINTAS CORPGRATION #319 08-00 136.10
COMED COMED 08-00 692.38
COREM CORE & MAIMN LP 08-00 9,375.00
HIRSC ERIC HIRSCH IR 08-00 250.00
MWG MIDWEST WATER GROUP INC. 08-00 15,034.00
PDC POC LABORATORLES, INC 08-00 57.00
SAMS SAM'S CLUB 08-00 100.00
SHORE SHORFWOOD HOME & AUTO INC 08-00 284,10
TE TYSON ENGINEERING 08-00 23,581.75
TRIBE TRIBUNE YEDIA GROUP 08-00 220.47
#XTOTAL 54,823.61
08 WATER & SEWER GRAND TOTAL  54,823.61
GRAND TOTAL FOR ALL FUNDS: 227,581.80
TOTAL FOR REGULAR CHECKS: 227,581.80



SYS DATE:04/12/18 village of Monee

SYS TIME:16:09

CLAIM SHEET [Nes)
DATE: 04/12/18 Thursday April 12, 2018 PAGE 1
VENDOR # NAME DEPT. AMOUNT
01 CORPORATE FUND
COMED COMED 01-00 15.39
FIRS1 FIRST MIDWEST BANK 01-0¢ 1,445.23
GASCI PINKERTON OIL/GAS CITY 01-00 2,015.06
NEOPO NEOFUNDS BY NEQPOST 01-00 102.97
OBROS OLIVIERI EROTHERS, INC 01-00 1,010.00 .
TE TYSON ENGINEERING 01-00 3,245.25
HHTOTAL 7,833.90
BHA BLACK HILLS AMMUNITION 01-21 1,937.50
EAGLE FAGLE UNIFORM 0., INC. 01-21 123.00
FEDEX FEDEX 01-21 96.00
FIRs1 FIRST MIDWEST BANK 01-21 2,132.07
IFPE ILLINOIS FIRE & POLICE EQUIP, 01-21 68.00
1M JCM UNIFORMS 01-21 49,98
KOERN SCOTT KOERNER 01-21 50.00
LWCC LARAWAY CCMMUNICATIONS CENTER  01-21 10,146.75
MS MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS 01-21 782.00
NAPA NAPA AUTO PARTS MONEE 01-21 49,99
NEOPQ NEOFUNDS BY NEOPOST 01-21 100.00
TCGRS THE COMPOUND GUN REPAIR SHOP, LTDO1-21 835.00
FETOTAL 16,370.29
CINTS CINTAS CORPORATION #319 01-22 692.16
DMC DMC SECURITY SERVICES INC, 01-22 1315.50
MENAR MENARDS 01-22 777.70
STANS STANLEY STEEMER INTERNATIONAL, IN01-22 273.00
WEHLI WEHLING LAWN CARE 01-22 158.00
“ETOTAL 2,016.36
FIRS1 FIRST MIDWEST BANK 0i-61 26.80
TE TYSON EMGINEERING 01-61 11,213.50
HETGTAL 11,240.30
COMED COMED 01-7¢ 629.71
DEANB BRETT DEAN 01-70 1,200,006
FIRS1 FIRST MIDWZST BANK 01-70 1,154.75
FETOTAL 2,984.46
01 CORPORATE FUND GRAND TOTAL  40,445.31
ADVAP ADVANCE ALTO PARTS 02-00 16.54
CINTS CINTAS CORPORATION #319 02-00 59.12
COMED COMED 02-00 823.99
MENAR MENARDS (z-00 77.97
NAPA NAPA AUTO PARTS MONEE 02-00 19.32
TE TYSON ENGINEERING 02-00 6,389.75
WELDS WELDSTAR COMPANY 02-00 48,60
*ATOTAL 7,435.29
02 ROAD & BRIDGE GRAND TOTAL  7,435.2%
AQUA AQUA TLLINOIS 08-00 49,637.23
BACKF BACK FLOW SOLUTIONS, INC 08-00 495,00
CINTS CINTAS CORPORATION #319 08-00 68,05
COMED COMED 08-00 1,457.13
COREM CORE & MAIN LP 08-00 5,963.12
DMC DMC SECURLTY SERVICES INC. 08-00 132.00
ETPLA ETP LABS INC 08-00 88.00



SYS DATE:04/12/18
DATE: 04/12/18
VENDOR #

village of Monee

SYS TIME:16:09

CLAIM SHEET [NCs]
Thursday April 12, 2018 PAGE 2
NAME DEPT. AMOUNT

08 WATER & SEWER

FIRSL
MCCAN
MENAR
TE

AMALG

—

]

FIRST MIDWEST BANK

MCCANN INDUSTRIES, INC

MENARDS

TYSON ENGINEERING
HETOTAL

08 WATER & SEWER

AMALGAMATED BANK OF CHICAGO

TRTOTAL

10 BOND & INTEREST

TYSON ZNGINEERING

#HTOTAL

14 TIF 3

GRAND TCTAL FOR ALL FUNDS:

TOTAL FCR REGULAR CHECKS:

08-00 1,045.69
08-00 11.46
08-00 17.98
08-00 37,044.25

95,959.91

GRAND TOTAL  95,959.91

10-60 475.00
475.00

GRAND TOTAL 475.00
14-00 7,765.75
7,765.75

GRAND TOTAL 7,765.75

152,081.26

152,081.26



SYS DATE:04/13/18

village of Monee

SYS TIME:10:42

CCLATIHM SHEET (NCs)
DATE: 04/13/18 Friday April 13, 2018 PAGE 1
VENDOR # NAME DEPT. AMOUNT
01 CORPORATE FUND
AFLAC AFLAC 01-00 2,597.06
URBA1L URBANCOM.NET FIBER OPERATIONS, IN01-0027 300.00
URBAN URBAN COMMUNTCATIONS INC,-#2428 01-00 290,30
#TOTAL 3,187.36
URBAN URBAN COMMUNICATIONS INC.-#2428 01-21 400.00
FETOTAL 4006.00
URBAN URBAN COMMUNICATIONS INC.-#2428 01-61 200.00
*RTOTAL 200,00
URBAN URBAN COMMUNICATIONS INC,-#2428 01-70 200.00
FETOTAL 200.00
01 CORPORAT= FUND GRAND TOTAL 3,987.36
URBAN URBAN COMMUNICATIONS INC.-#2428 02-00 200.00
HHTOTAL 200,00
07 ROAD & BRIDGE GRAND TOTAL 200.00
URBAN URBAN COMMUNTCATIONS INC.-#2428 05-00 200,00
FETOTAL 200.00
(5 ESDA GRAND TOTAL 200.00
UREAN URBAN COMMUWICATIONS INC.-#2428 08-00 400,00
*ETQTAL 400.00
08 WATER & SEWER GRAND TOTAL 400.00
GRAND TOTAL FOR ALL FUNDS: 4,787.36
TOTAL FQR REGULAR CHECKS: 4,787.36



SYS DATE:04/12/18

village of Monee

$ys TIME:16:09

WARRANT LIST (1]
REGISTER # 754

DATE: 04/12/18 Thursday April 12, 2018 PAGE 1

PAYABLE TO AMOUNT
INV NO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION DISTR

01 ADVANCE AUTO PARTS 16.54
7758809443423 02-00-520 OIL ABSORBENT. 16. 54

01 AMALGAMATED BANK OF CHICAGO 475.00
739004-4/1/18 10-00-730 BONDS 475.00

01 AQUA ILLINOIS 49637.23
81833-03/27/18  08-00-535 RT 50. FLOW METER 33253.95
81974-03/27/18  08-00-535 GOLF VISTA. FLOW METER 16383.28

01 BACK FLOW SOLUTIONS, INC 495,00
2777 08-00-521 SUBCRIPT DUFS 455,00

01 BLACK HILLS AMMUNITION 1937.50
235499 01-21-650 PD AMMUNITION 1937.50

01 CINTAS CORPORATION #319 819.33
319396007 01-22-516 P.B. MAT 41,32
319396007 01-22-512 V.H, MATS 31.90
319396007 01-22-511 PARK BUILDING MATS 31.90
319396007 03-00-€64 UNTFORM CLEANING 68.05
319396007 02-00-664 UNIFORM CLEANING 59,12
319396813 01-22-514 Py 18.97
319396813 01-22-512 V.H. 93.02
319396813 01-22-516 P.B. 55.05
319398444 01-22-513 PD CLEANING 375.00
319398754 01-22-513 PD MAT CLEANING 45,00

01 comeD 2926.22
1044-03/27/18 01-70-511 FIREMAN'S PARK. 5150 W. COURT ST #.12
3100-04/03/2018  02-00-577 SIGNAL I-57 586.15
4013-03/29/18 08-00-574 LIFT STATION. INDUSTRIAL 127,17
4098-03/28/18 02-00-577 TRAFFIC SIGNAL. 5600 MM RD. 63.44
4396-03/29/18 02-00-577 ROUND ABOUT LIGHTING 72.41
6004-03/29/18 08-00-574 STORM LIFT STATION 1056.27
6044-03/29/18 08-00-573 WELL HOUSE 3 1173.80
7000-03/27/18 01-00-571 V.H. 5130 W COURT ST 15.39%
7007-03/27/18 01-70-511 §162 W. COURT STREET UNIT A 556.79
7039-03/30/18 02-00-577 5608 . SUTTON PL. STREET LIGHTS 8.93
7061-03/30/18 02-00-577 5602 W. SUTTON PL. STREET LIGHTS §.93
8013-03/27/18 01-70-511 BASEBALL. 5210 COURT STREET 38.80
8032-03/29/18 02-00-577 COURT ST. CONTROLLER 73.61
9004-03/30/18 08-00-574 25629 LINDEN., LIFY STATION 49,89
9070-03/29/18 02-00-577 STREET LIGHT. 5501 MAIN ST 10.52

01 CORE & MAIN LP 5963.12
1638015 08-00-521 METER MAINT 5195,12
1638023 08-00-521 WATER METER MAINT 768.00

01 BRETT DEAN 1200.00
04/12/18 01-70-517 MUSIC IN THE PARK 1200.00

01 DMC SECURITY SERVICES INC. 247.50
277780 08-00-521 WELL HOUSE 3 ALARMS 66.00
277781 08-00-521 ALARM WELL HOUSE 4. £6.00



S5YS DATE:04/12/18

Village of Monee

SYS TIME;16:09
[hwl?

A/P WARR Q ysz LIST
REGISTER
DATE: 04/12/18 Thursday april 12, 2018 PAGE 2
PAYABLE TO AMOUNT
INV NO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION DISTR
277782 01-22-511 FIRE ALARM. PARK BUILDING 115.50
01 EAGLE UNIFORM €0., INC, 123.00
258101 01-21-664 PD UNTFORMS/A. LAZZARONT 25.00
258370 01-21-664 PD UNIFORMS/A. LAZZARDNE 88.00
01 ETP LABS INC 88.00
18-133066 08-0-659 LABS 88.00
01 FEDEX 96.00
6-139-73785 01-21-551 PD POSTAGE 96.00
(01 FIRST MIDWEST BANK 5804 .54
03/29/2018 01-00-929 TRAVEL 40.00
03/29/2018 08-00-567 TRAVEL 31.21
03/29/2018 08-09-562 TRAVEL 506.24
03/29/2018 (18-00-562 TRAVEL 506.24
03/29/2018 01-07-551 POSTAGE 26.80
03/29/2018 01-61-551 POSTAGE 26.80
03/29/2018 1-01-562 TRAVEL 193.80
03/29/2018 01-21-520 PD VEHICLE MAINT 10.00
03/28/2018 (1-21-551 PD POSTAGE 13.40
03/29/2018 (-21-561 DUES 33.60
(3/29/2018 0!-21-651 PD OFFICE SUPPLIES 65.24
03/29/2018 0°-21-651 PF OFFICE SUPPLIES 33.96
03/29/2018 0.-21-561 DUES 12.99
03/29/2018 01-21-562 TRAVEL 128.82
03/29/2018 01-21-520 VEHICLE MAINT 1.0.00
03/29/2018 0i-21-831 PD OFFICE SUPPLIES 91.22
03/29/2018 0:i-21-651 PD OFFICE SUPPLIES 33.10
03/29/2018 0:-21-651 PD OFFICE SUPPLIES 10.%0
03/29/2018 $i-21-653 TOOLS 598.02
03/29/2018 01-21-653 CREDIT 50.70-
03/29/2018 0i-21-831 OFFICE EQUIP 176.98
03/29/2018 01-21-653 TOOLS EQUIP 13.79
03/29/2018 01-21-561 DUES 12.9
03/29/2018 01-21-664 UNIFORMS 230.56
03/29/2018 0i-21-831 NEW OFFICE EQUIP PD $60.30
03/29/2018 01-21-551 PD POSTAGE 46.90
03/29/2018 0L-00-562 TRAVEL 35.00
03/29/2018 01-00-562 TRAVEL 167.00
03/29/2018 (1-00-562 TRAVEL 193.80
03/29/2018 (1-00-562 TRAVEL 93.80
03/29/2018 0§-00-562 TRAVEL 146.90
03/29/2018 01-00-562 TRAVEL 66.00
03/29/2018 01-00-585 TECH SERVICES 51.97
03/25/2018 01-00-585 TECH SERVICES 30.16
03/29/2013 01-70-937 PROGRAM EXPENSES 9.7?
03/29/2018 01-70-937 PROGRAMS 13.98
03/29/2018 01-70-520 SPECIAL EVENTS 515.35
03/29/2018 01-70-937 PROGRAM EXPENSE 03.55



SYS DATE:04/12/18

Village of Monee

SYS TIME:16:09

A/P WARRANT LIST (Nw1]
REGISTER # 754

DATE: 04/12/18 Thursday april 12, 2018 PAGE 3

PAYABLE TO AMOUNT
INV NO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION DLSTR
13/29/2018 01-70-518 SENIOR LUNCH IN SUPPLIES 3.3
03/29/2018 01-70-518 SENTOR PROGRAM 230.83

(01 PINKERTON QIL/GAS CITY 2015.06
298460 01-00-160 GAS 750.51
298461 01-00-160 GAS 313.96
299061 01-00-160 GAS 950.59

01 ILLINOIS FIRE & POLICE EQUIP, 68.00
30079 01-21-664 PD UNIFORMS/FARIAS 68.00

01 JCM UNTFORMS 49.98
742425 01-71-664 PO UNIFORMS/KOERNER 49,98

01 SCOTT KOERNER 50.00
04/09/18 01-21-566 CHIEFS MEETING 5%.400

01 LARAWAY COMMUNTCATIONS CENTER 10146.75
03/27/18 01-21-584 DISPATCH FOR APRIL 2018 10146.75

0% MCCANN INDUSTRIES, INC 11.46
08051869 (8-00-520 UNIT 2, LATCH 11,46

01 MENARDS 873.65
70813 02-00-653 BPW TOOLS .9
70813 01-22-512 V.H. MAINT 73.93
70813 01-22-513 PD MAINT 54.88
70813 01-22-514 DPW MAINT 348.91
70813 08-00-523 WATER MAINT 17.98
71005 01-22-510 DEHUMIDIFIER 149.99
71005 01-22-519 DPW 3 DEHUMIDIFIER 149,99

{1 MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS 782.00
350462282018 01-21-832 COMMUNICATIONS FD 782.00

01 NAPA AUTO PARTS MONEE £9.31
116014 01-21-520 PD. BRAKE PADS. VEHICLE MAINT 49,99
116887-REENTER  92-00-520 TRUCK 5 WIRE KIT 19.32

0% NEOFUNDS BY NEOPOST 202.97
0472-03/30/18 01-21-551 PD POSTAGE 108,00
0718-03/30/18 01-00-551 POSTAGE 102.97

01 OLTVIERT BROTHERS, INC 1010.00
12075 01-00-584 V.H. REMODEL. 2ND STUDY COMPLETE 1010.00

UL STANLEY STEEMER INTERNATIONAL, 273.00
12849310-68 (1-22-516 PARK CLEANING 229,00
12849310-68 (1-22-512 V.H. CLEANING 44,00

01 7HE COMPOUND GUN REPAIR SHOP, 835.00
03/20/18 01-21-650 AMMUNITION AND FIREARM MAINT; PO 835,00

01 TYSON ENGINEERING 65658.50
18020157 01-00-581 17-T0543, SURVEY WORK. B.K/EGYPT TR 265650
18020463 01-00-581 18-70004. MISC ENGINEERTNG 330.50
18020464 14-00-903 18-T0004. MISC ENGINEERING 365.75
18030082 02-00-581 16-T0263 MAIN ST DRAINAGE IMPROVE, . 6389.7%
18030083 08-00-581 17-710359,02, MD ELEVATED TANK. 2400000
18030084 08-00-581 17-10534 IL RT S0 WATER MAIN LOOP 2000.00
18030086 01-09-581 SURVEY WORK.17-T(G543; B.K/EGYPT TRL 256.25



SYS DATE:04/12/18 village of Monee SYS TIME:16:09

A/P WARRANT LIST [nw1]
REGISTER # 754

DATE: 04/12/18 Thursday April 12, 2018 PAGE 4

PAYABLE TO AMOUNT
INV NO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION 0ISTR
18030088 01-61-581 BAILLY RIDGE.17-T0553.0FF SITE IMPR 4825.25
18030090 01-61-581 BAILLY RIDGE. FUELING SITE.17-T0609 199,25
18030091 08-00-581 17-T0643, LYNN LN WTR MAIN/RD IMPRY 10200.00
18030096 14-00-903 17-10713. BC DRAINAGE REVIEW 7400.00
18030100 (8-00-581 18-T0004. MISC ENGINEERING 344,25
18040042 01-61-581 17-TG591, BAILLY RIDGE REVIEWS 1257.75
18040049 01-61-581 17-T0553 OFF SITE IMPROV. BAILLY R. 4831.25

01 WEHLING LAWN CARE 158.00
03/22/18 01-22-512 LAWN CARE V.H. 120.00
03/22/18-pD 01-22-513 LAWN CARE PD 18.00

01 WELDSTAR COMPANY 48.60
01645059 02-00-929 QUARTERLY CYLINDER RENT 48.60

*%  TOTAL CHECKS 70 BE ISSUED 152081, 26



SYS DATE:04/12/18 village of Monee SYS TIME:16:09
AP WARRANT LIST [nw1]
REGISTER # 754

DATE: 04/12/18 Thursday April 12, 2018 PAGE  $
FUND AMOUNT

INV NO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION DISTR
CORPORATE FUND 4044531
R0AD & BRIDGE 7435.29
WATER & SEWER 95959.91
BOND & INTEREST 475.00
TIF 3 7765.75
FEE GRAND TOTAL *%¥ 152081.26

TOTAL FOR REGULAR CHECKS: 152,081.26



SYS DATE:04/13/18

village of Monee

SYS TIME:10:41

AfP WARRANT LIST [Nw1]
_ REGISTER # 755

DATE: 04/13/18 Friday april 13, 2018 PAGE 1

PAYABLE TO AMOUNT
INV NO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION DLSTR

01 AFLAC 2597.06
070532 01-00-224 EMPLOYEE INSURANCE 257 .06

(11 URBANCOM.NET FIBER OPERATIONS, 300.00
56782 01-00-585 INTERNET 30000

01 URBAN COMMUNICATIONS INC.-#242 1890.30
56783 01-00-552 PHONE 790.30
56783 01-21-552 PHONE 400,00
56783 01-61-552 PHONE 200.00
56783 01-70-552 PHONE 200,00
56783 02-03-552 PHONE 200.00
56783 05-00-552 PHONE 700.00
56783 08-00-552 PHONE 400.00

%% TOTAL CHECKS TO 8E ISSULD 4787.36



SYS DATE:04/13/18

village of Monee

SYs TIME:10: 41
(w1

A/P WARRANT LIST
. REGISTER # 755

DATE: 04/13/18 Friday April 13, 2018 PAGE 2
FUND AMOUNT

INV HO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION DISTR
CORPORATE FUND 3987.36
ROAD & BRIDGE 200.00
ESDA 200.00
WATER & SEWER 400,00
*%E GRAND TOTAL *%% 4787.36

TOTAL FOR REGULAR CHECKS:

4,787.36



SYS DATE:04/19/18

Village of Monee

SYS TIME:15:58

AJP WARRANT LIST [ww1]
REGISTER # 756

DATE: (4/19/18 Thursday April 19, 2018 PAGE 1

PAYABLE TO AMOUNT
INV NO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION DISTR

01 ADVANCE AUTO PARTS 223,95
7758810068127 05-00-520 UNIT 29, BUS 44.69
7758810168154 02-00-520 TRUCK 12, TIE ROD 122.09
7758810168163 02-00-520 TRUCK 12, 11.50
7758810768313 02-00-520 AIR & OIL FILTERS, UNIT 30 45.67

01 ANCEL GLINK DIAMOND 2475.00
63088 01-00-583 LEGAL SERVICES ' 2475.00

01 BOUND TREE MEDICAL LLC 712.96
82831977 01-22-512 V.H, MAINT 237.65%
82831977 01-22-514 DPW MAINT 237.65
82831977 01-22-511 P.B. MAINT 237.66

01 CHRISTINE CALLARD 6. 00
04/14/18 01-70-525 ZUMBA 60.00

(1 CHIEF SUPPLY/LAW ENFORCEMENT § 5092.81
168668 08-00-831 TABLET MOUNTING, VEHICLE 5092.81

01 CINTAS CORPORATION #31% 1501.12
319398863 08-00-664 UNIFORMS 68.0%
319398863 02-00-664 UNIFORMS 59.12
319398863 01-22-516 PARKS MAINT 41.32
319398863 01-22-512 V.H. MAINT 31,90
319398863 01-22-511 PARK BUELDING 31.90
319399665 01-22-514 DPW 18.97
319399665 01-22-512 VH 93.02
319399665 01-22-516 PARKS 58.0%
319401284 01-22-513 PD CLEANING 375.00
319401573 (1-22-513 PD MAINT 45.00
319401679 01-22-516 DPW 41.32
319401679 01-22-512 V.H. 31.90
319401679 01-22-511 PARK BUILDING 31.90
319401679 08-00-664 UNTFORMS 68.05
319401679 02-00-654 UNIFORMS 59,12
319402481 01-22-514 DPW 37.82
319402481 01-22-512 V. H. 88.56
319402481 01-22-516 PARK BUILDING 54.84
5010361077 01-22-515 EMA FIRST AID 160.28
5010361078 01-22-516 V.H. FIRST AID 24.04
5010361079 01-22-516 P.B. FIRST AID 83.56

01 COMCAST CABLE 314.70
06316-4/1/18 01-21-552 INTERNET PD 124.85
181844-4/1/13 05-00-552 EMA INTERNET 189.85

01 COMED 692.38
0161-04/05/18 08-00-574 LIFT STATION. EAGLE FAIR 474,50
8062-04/05/18 08-00-574 LIFT STATION. DERBY MEACOWS 717 .88

(1 COMPASS MINERALS AMERICA 3386.08
246669 03-00-614 ROAD SALT 3386.08

01 CORE & MAIN LP 9375.00



SYS DATE:04/19/18

Village of Monee

SYS TIME:15:58

AJP WARRANT LTIST [4L]
REGISTER # 756

DATE: 04/19/18 Thursday April 19, 2018 PAGE 2

PAYABLE TO AMOUNT
INV NO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION BISTR
1185104 08-00-521 METER UPDATES 9375.00

01 CULLIGAN WATER CONDITIONING 132.75
1093575 01-22-512 CULLIGAN WATER 36.02
945643-04/15/18  01-21-662 PD BOTTLED WATER 96.73

01 DIGITAL-ALLY, INC. 4025.00
MONIL? 01-21-526 DYM KIT 4025.00

01 PETER FARIAS 50.00
04/14/2018 01-70-525 MUAY THAT 50.00

01 FEDEX 96.44
6-147-46774 01-21-551 PD POSTAGE 96.44

01 FOREST SOUTH ANIMAL HOSPITAL 100.35
553095335 01-21-933 STRAY ANIMAL 100.35

01 PINKERTON OIL/GAS CITY 2591.40
299670 01-00-160 GAS 920.40
300483 01-00-160 GAS 1029.76
300513 01-00-160 GAS 641.24

01 GTSAC INC. 455.00
2017866 01-00-585 TECH ASSIST 455.00

01 ERIC HIRSCH IR 250.00
04/19/2018 08-00-215 WATER DEPOSIT REFUND 250.00

01 ILLINOGIS FIRE & POLICE EQUIP. 1646.00
30101 01-21-520 PD MAINT 1526.00
30113 01-21-653 PD EQUIP 120.00

01 INTERSTATE BATTERY OF CHICAGO 2926.80
20695034 01-22-511 P.B. 400.00
20695034 01-22-512 V.H. 400.00
20695034 01-22-514 DPW 400,00
20695034 01-22-516 PARK 400,00
20695034 01-22-515 EMA 400¢.00
20695034 05-00-520 EMA 400,00
20695035 (1-22-512 V.H. 263.40
20695035 01-22-514 DPY 263.40

{01 TEAMSTERS LOCAL 700 1241.00
MAY 2018-Dpw 01-00-222 DUES FOR DPW FOR MAY 2018 358.00
MAY 2018-PD 01-00-222 DUES FOR PD FOR MAY 2018 883.00

01 MAILFINANCE 267.60
N7056364 01-00-551 POSTAGE RENTAL MACHINE 267,60

01 MENARDS 374.89
72534 01-22-510 CREAMERY 216.13
72534 01-22-653 TOOLS EQUIP 158.76

01 MONROE TRUCK EQUIPMENT INC 501.41
320238 02-00-520 PLOW MOUNT 501.41

01 MIDWEST WATER GROUP INC. _ . 15034.00
9652 08-00-521 WELL 3. ANALYZER 7517.00
9667 08-00-521 WELL 4. ANALYZER 7517.00

01 NAPA AUTO PARTS MONEE 119.93
123329 01-21-520 UNIT 15 119.93



SYS DATE:04/19/18

vitlage of Monee

5Y$ TIME:15:58

A/P WARRANT LIST (w1l
REGISTER # 756

DATE: 04/19/18 Thursday April 19, 2018 PAGE 3

PAYABLE TO AMOUNT
INV NO G/L NUMRER DESCRIPTION DISTR

(01 NCPERS GROUP LIFE INS. 304.00
0372018 01-00-225 INSURANCE FOR 03/2018 128.00
04/2018 01-00-225 INSURANCE FOR 04/2018 176.00

01 POC LABORATORIES, INC 57.00
893358 08-00-659 LABS 57.00

(01 PERFORMANCE COATING, INC 125.00
1306 02-00-520 NEW FENDER 125.0¢

01 RAINBOW FARMS ENTERPRISES, INC 131.50
35788 01-22-539 LANDSCAPE BLANKET 131.5¢

01 RED WING 300,00
20180410029827 02-00-664 BCOTS; UNIFORM 300.00

01 RWK IT SERVICES 2250.00
4553 01-21-653 TECH ASSISTANCE 225000

01 saM's CLuB 988.40
QuGB18 01-22-512 V.H. 444,20
000818 01-22-513 PO, 444,20
000818 (08-00-529 MEMBERSHIP RENEWAL 100,00

{11 SHOREWOOD HOME & AUTO INC 342.12
02-62007 08-00-653 HOSE KIT. PUMP 284,10
02-64164 02-00-653 SNOW WHEEL ;SALT SPREADER 58.02

01 SOUTH SUBURBAN MAYDRS & MNGR. 100.00
2018-168 01-00-562 DUES 100.00

01 STATE OF ILLINOIS 136523.88
121788 02-00-837 EGYPTIAN TRAIL #4 136523, 88

01 STERLING CODIFIERS, INC. 1237.00
20688 01-00-935 STERLING CODIFLERS DUES 1237.00

01 THE COMPOUND GUN REPAIR SHOP, ' 1450.00
04/03/18 01-21-650 PD FTREARM MAINT 1450.00

{1 TYSON ENGINEERING 29437.50
18040044 01-00-581 14-T402 ; INDUSTRIAL DISTRICT IMPROVE 648,25
18040045 (1-22-519 16-T0262; 6025 INDUSTRIAL DR. 1416.25
18040046 02-00-581 16-10263.10. E£MBRI,HERBERT,LYNN 2329.00
18040047 (08-00-581 17-T0359.02, NEW ELEVATED TANK 18000, 00
18040048 (8-00-581 17-70534; WATER MAIN L0OP 2000, 00
1804005¢ 01-61-581 17-T0667. NORTHERN BUILDERS. 351,75
18040055 01-61-581 18-R0363 MCCORKLE DEVELOP 299,25
18040056 02-00-581 18-R0364; KUERSTEN RD CULVERT INVES 811,25
18040060 (8-00-581 17-T0643; LYNN LANE WATER MAIN 358L.75

01 TERRY'S EORD, LINCOLN-MERCURY 79.95
16540 02-00-520 TRUCK 1?. WHEEL ALIGNMENT 79,95

01 TRIBUNE MEDIA GROUP 327.05
003539859 01-00-673 PUBLICATION; DR SHEETZ 106.58
(03539859 08-00-838 PUBLICATION; BID/WELL 220.47

01 DANIEL TROFIMCHUK 5.00
04/16/18 01-00-92% 8US D.L. TEST 5,00

01 WALTON OFFICE SUPPLY 199.44



SYS DATE:04/19/18 village of Monee SYS TIME;15:58

A/P WARRANT LTIST [Hwl]
REGISTER # 756
DATE: 04/19/18 Thursday April 19, 2018 PAGE 4
PAYABLE TO AMOUNT
INV NO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION DISTR
304246-0 01-006-651 OFFICE SUPPLIES 199.44
01 GLOVER WASHINGTON 60.00
04/14/18 01-70-525 TAE KWON DO 60.00
01 WEX BANK 17.39
53720990 01-21-655 GAS 17.39

*%  TOTAL CHECKS TO BE ISSUED _ 227581.80



SYS DATE:(04/19/18 village of Monee SYS TIME:15:58
AfP WARRANT LIST [iw1]
REGISTER # 756

DATE: 04/19/18 Thursday April 19, 2018 PAGE 5
FUND AMOUNT

INV NO G/L NUMBER DESCRIPTION DISTR
CORPORATE FUND 27711.56
ROAD & BRIDGE 141026.01
MFT 3386.08
ESDA 634.54
WATER & SEWER ' 54823.61
wiE GRAND TOTAL #** 227581.80

TOTAL FOR REGULAR CHECKS: 227,581.80



Village of Monee

Agenda ltem: H- 1
Meeting Date: April 26, 2018
Subject: Rt. 50 Water Main Loop — Bid Results

By: David Wallace, Administrator

Board Action Request

At the March 14, 2018 Village Board Meeting authorization to bid the above project was
granted. The results of the bid process shows there were seven (7) bidders on the project with
a bid range of $169,847.51 to $295,000.00. The recommended lowest qualified bidder as
recommended by Tyson Engineering is [roquois Paving Corp. in the amount of $169,847.51.

The recommendation letter from Tyson Engineering is attached for your review.

Action Requested:  Motion to accept the bid from Iroguois Paving Corp in the amount of
$169,847.51 and to authorize the Mayor and Clerk to sign the contracts.



T L N E R R G
Geoff Aggen, PE
Cract Fhone {815) 464-2664

pagaon@reltd.com
April 24, 2018

Project 17-T0634
Village of Monee
5130 West Count Street
Monee, IL 60449
Altention; Mr. DJ Kruzel, Public Works Superintendent

RE: Village of Monee
Water Main Loop on lllinois Route 50 (Govarnors Highway)

Dear Mr. Kruzel:

We have reviewed the bids recelved on April 23, 2018 for the referenced project, and find them
to be as follows:

Iroquois Paving Corp. $169,847.51
Scanlon Excavating & Concrete, Inc. $227,394.25 (Corrected)
Tenco Excavating, Inc. $243,085.00
P.T. Ferro Construction Co. $250,614.01
Airy's Inc, $262,084.00
Steve Spless Construction, Inc. $274,452.80
M&J Underground, Inc. $295,000.00

Please note that the as-read bid for Scanlon Excavating & Concrete ($146,439.25), Inc., was
incorrect based on the unit prices submilted and the number above is the correct total bid. As
seen on the enclosed itemized bid tabulation, the actual low bid of lroquois Paving Corp. is
approximately 39% lower than the estimated cost of $280,675.00.

We, therefore, recommend that the contract be awarded to the low bidder, Iroquols Paving
Corporation in the amount of One Hundred Sixty-Nine Thousand Eight Hundred Forty-Seven

and 51/100 Dollars ($169,847.51).

If you have any questions, or need addilional information, please contact me at your
convenience.

Vary truly yours,
TYSON ENGINEERING, INC.
soft Ay~

Geoff Aggen, PE
Project Engineer

fga
Y2017\ 7-Te534\Cotraspondence\ 7-T0534 Award Recommendation.doc

Encl.
XC: Iroquois Paving Corp. (wfo encl.)

367 S. Schuyler Ave, < Kankakee, It 60901-3811 < (815}932-7406 < Fax (815)932-2951 < wwwliysoneng.com




Village of Monee

Agenda ltem:; H -2
Meeting Date: April 26, 2018
Subject: Main Street Drainage Improvements — Bid Resuits

By: David Wallace, Administrator

Board Action Request

At the March 14, 2018 Village Board Meeting authorization to bid the above project was
granted. The results of the bid process shows there were seven (7) bidders on the project with
a bid range of $195,042.80 to $328,000.00, The recommended lowest qualified bidder as
recommended by Tyson Engineering is Iroquois Paving Corp. in the amount of $195,042.80.

The recommendation letter from Tyson Engineering is attached for your review.

Action Recuested:  Motion to accept the bid from froquois Paving Corp in the amount of
$195,042.80 and to authorize the Mayor and Clerk to sign the contracts.



S EYSon

B T A N I AT
Gaoff Aggen, PE

Direct Phane (815) 454-2664

rapren@relid.con

April 24, 2018
Project 16-T0263

Village of Monee

5130 West Court Streat

Monee, Il 60449

Altention; Mr. DJ Kruzel, Public Works Superintendent

RE: \Village of Monee
Main Strest Drainage Improvements

Dear Mr. Kruzel;

We have reviewed the bids received on April 23, 2018 for the referenced project, and find them
to be as follows:

Iroquois Paving Corp. $195,042.80
Tenco Excavating, Inc. $249,351.00
P.T. Ferro Construction Co. $257,753.41
Scanlon Excavating & Concrete, Inc. $257,881.25
Airy's Ing, $262,612.35
Steve Spiess Construction, Inc. $307,193.42
M&J Underground, Inc. $328,000.00

As seen on the enclosed itemized bid tabulation, the low bid is approximately 37% lower than
the estimated cost of $309,626.00.

We, therefore, recommend that the contract be awarded to the low bidder, Iroquois Paving
Corporation in the amount of One Hundred Ninety-Five Thousand Forty-Two and 80/100

Dollars ($195,042.80).

if you have any questions, or need additional information, please contact me at your
convenience.

Very truly yours,

TYSON ENGINEERING, INC.

Doty Ay~
Geoff Aggen, PE

Project Engineer

/ga
Y\2016114-T0263\Correspandance\i8-TO283 Award Recommendation.doc

Encl.
XG: Iroquois Paving Corp. (w/o encl.)

367 5. Schuyler Ave. o Kankakee, IL 60901-3811 <> (815)932-7406 < Fax(815) 932-7951 < WWW.AYSONEng.com




Village of Monee

Agenda ltem: H - 3
Meeting Date: April 26, 2018
Subject: Offer to Purchase Municipal Land

By: David Wallace, Administrator

Board Action Request

The village recently purchased two lots for the purpose of extending Cleveland Ave. to the
south. The village has received an offer to purchase a portion of the lot located directly north of
the Department of Public Works facility located on Industrial Drive. Attached please find an
Acquisition Letter of Intent from Northern Builders, Inc. to purchase 1.37 acres for the amount of
$59,677.

A copy of the letter is attached for your review.

Action Requested:  Motion to advertise the property as ‘surplus property’ and to aliow staff
and the village attorney to negotiate a real estate contract to be brought
before the village board for acceptance.



northern

Via email kdaly@villageofmonee.org

April 13, 2018

Mr. Kevin Daly

Economic Development Director
Legislative Affairs

Village of Monee

5130 W Court St

Monee, IL 60449

Regarding: Acquisition Letter of Intent

1.37 Acre Land Site @ Sunset Drive, Monee, lNinois

Dear Kevin:

Northern Builders, Inc. ("Buyer”) is pleased to present this Letter of Intent to the Village of Monee
("Seller") for the purchase of approximately 1.37 acres located on Sunset Drive in Monee, Hlinois as
generally depicted and highlighted on the enclosed Survey (“Property”).

1.

Purchase Price:
The purchase price for the 1.37 acre property shall be $59,677 ($1.00 per square foot).

Earnest Money Deposit;
Within three (3) business days after the full execution of a purchase contract, Buyer shall
deposit $10,000 with Chicago Title & Trust Company.

Due Diligence Period:

For a period of sixty (60) days after the purchase contract is fully executed ("Due Diligence
Period”), Buyer shall have the right to perform investigations concerning the physical aspects of
the Property, zoning, municipal requirements, environmental studies, title & survey review,
economic feasibility, market studies and any other investigation deemed appropriate by Buyer.

Seller agrees to provide Buyer with access to all records in Sefler's possession. After such
investigations, if Buyer determines that the Property is not satisfactory for purchase, then Buyer
may terminate the purchase contract and receive the return of its Eamest Money Deposit.

Closing Date:
The closing of the purchase of the Property shall take place at Chicago Title & Trust Company

within thirty (15) days after the Due Diligence Period expires.

Title and Survey:
Seller will provide, at Seller's expense, title insurance issued by Chicago Title & Trust Company

and a current ALTA survey in a form acceptable to Buyer. The Property shall be delivered free
and clear of any encumbrances, recapture, or offsite improvement reguirements.

NORTHERN BUILDERS, INC,

DEVELOPMENT
CONSTRUCTION

ot s SINCE 1027 LEASING & MANAGEMENT



northern

6.

10.

Prorations:

Operating expenses, real estate taxes and other items customarily prorated shall be prorated at
closing. Al state, county and municipal transfer taxes will be prorated in accordance with local
ordinance.

Broker Commissions;
No broker commissions shall be due with this transaction,

Documentation:
Promptly after the acceptance of this Letter of intent, Buyer shall prepare a purchase contract
consistent with the termis herain.

Other Offers & Right of First Refusal
Upon executing a signed lelter of intent, Seller agrees not to solicit or accept any offers to
purchase the subject Property.

Non-Binding Letter of intent:
This letter of intent is intended only to express the interest of the parties to purchase and sell the
Property and is not legaily binding.

If the terms of this Non-Binding Letter of Intent are acceptable, please execute where indicated and
return a copy to my attention.

Very truly yours,

U

Matthew J. Grusecki
Senior Vice President

ce: David Wallace, Village of Monee
Thomas D. Grusecki, Northern Builders, Inc.
Thomas R. Kenrich, Northern Builders, Inc,
AGREED TO AND ACCEPTED
on this day of 2018.
BY:
ITS:

NORTHERN BUILDERS, INC.

DEVELOPMENT
S CONSTRUGTION
SREIECRRR SINCE 1927 LEASING & MANAGEMENT



ALTA/NSPS LAND TITLE .Wﬁ..mw VEY

2
)
!
RIFTHURA LS, €45 EALEAT
WA fib2- 1

i o :
[w] - - - - T —

NETAT TS 26D. . ! NEF 4TS T3 TS ) SEMT T e 50
heaT G {-2811T) |y =SS e i T

wod _l\E e eooLoanen LIE 2 aEGEND

¥

“T i RCN PPL RECOMERED

) | o ke

nﬂhm , woN 30D RECOVERSD

v , UONUMENT RECOVERED

‘

WON RO} SET

U RECORDED DWMENSION
MEASURED DMMENTION

H
5 i
=~ = ;
3 |
2 e 1
2 1.99 ACRES M ERESHIE 2.50 ACRES 5 —
I = =
W , 32 mwmua T g 100,880.64 SF 7 J—
] b2 mn..ui.m 3 m % Z Bl 47 POWER POLE WW LIGHT
= Al RS
m o h% "\r..l...il!..l';lxll.:r..s]l..l'l||.||-wlw_.l T TILEROME PESISTA
& ;A ) -
= 4 3 e e s o : . & P waER w0
- \\ugc&%ésﬂlipﬁ w | o '
_ - | — i 2 NOTE: BEARIMCS ARE RELATVE
B L OF DINTRG VTR P “, L_ 5. H TO SUPDMSION FoAw.
3T VEROR PP DS ' By
o oORAEY IO OTIET Ed ! 2
L T R R . = |
u!.uﬂl“”“””lh..”.”i“lnlﬂ 4 1. al ny !
i I =
\§E1§Q§§n§ _ ~m ! i : = 1
Rl el L _ mO“ I e Mt e 3 )
e RSN ey ! e o { ;
TRITAT U7 -0 ) N [ . SELAY 3 W=3E2.14 P I § mm :
/ nwu.um.§ [ i Ll B [ 3614 cmxy = ] mw H
AR UMK FINCE 1 R o NS S ! EE !
! ! ; =5, R =
i . ag! ] m..u i
§-2 ﬂ 7 s i EE
=

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

TO: WFG NATIONAL TITLE INSURANCE COMPANY, VILLAGE OF MONEE
Lot 3 and Lot 6 in Monae Manhatian Subdivision Unk 1, 3 Subdivision of part of the Southwesl Quarter of
Section 20, Township 34 Noab, Ranoa 13 Eas: of the Third Principad Mericeo, in Wil County, linois

l:.m.unonﬂ._.?.g?auno.‘lu.maq.e survay o which il nﬁawmuaima&n—a!auuamﬂﬂuiﬂ:i

adopted by ALTA and NSPS in 2016 The K wat

Dated: November 16, 2017 . NOTES:
1 . R “
Y Ty LIPLS 035002997 Expies 11-30-16 u...ﬂ.. =% 1. This professionsl servwce cenforrns (o tho 206 Minimum Slanca Detail Requirements for an
Jghn C. Sarrelt Tyzen Enginooring, Ine. P V3 ALTANSPS Land Tiie Survey
. 367 Sauth Sehwyler Avenue Kankakad, Il 60901 T = 2 Peato i§§§§£§§ﬂ<3§§
- Design Fireh License $184-001136 Jobw17-Y0ESL 2 Y - 3, Compare a1 ponis bolore building Sy S0 0nG MOTKN Mty BCrenInoies I, orod.
' .mc\.\// N 5. Buddivg lines, i ary. showe Neeagn 2ro Buding favas Thown on the reootded cubdivision piat
NOTES:. Survey is nol vald withoul sunveyor's origmai signatyre and saa \..o.q»m, et 5. Commslt kit authonses i Butding knos exiabizhed by oK drananet:
ey OF AR o 6. Tite Cornmitrment prowided by WEG Nallanal Tele irsurancs Cospany. Commilment No 162715714, n\..‘“ meNH
Ay dsted ODctober 13, 2017 ’Fl.\l.\\ I e nine
ot v o pomerns
LAmD BT




Will County lllinois

VILLAGE of MONEE “

[-5-A
PROPOSED FEE SCHEDULE 2.28.18
A. New Residential Structures
a. New Construction - INCLUDES electric, plumbing & HVAC

i. Residential - Single Family $2000.00
ii. Townhouse-Each dwelling unit $2000.00
iii. Apartments-Each dwelling unit $550.00
iv. —Each floor common area $330.00
v. Condominiums-Each dwelling unit $550.00
vi. —-Each floor common area $330.00
vii. Foundation only $400.00

viii. Clubhouse/shared accessory structures $550.00

B. Commercial -Industrial-Storage-Business-Intuitional-Public & Multi-Family — Does NOT
INCLUDE electric, plumbing & HVAC

Square Footage Cost per Square Foot
a. Up to 150,000 $.72
b. 150,001 to 250,000 $.66
c. 250,001 to 350,000 $.61
d. 350,001 to 450,000 $.56
e. 450,001 to 550,000 $.50
f. 550,001 to 650,000 $.44
g. 650,001 to 750,000 $.39
h. Over 750,001 $.33

C. Agriculture Buildings
a. New Construction - Additions-Accessory
i. $.33 psf for all areas, but not less than $75.00

D. Alterations and Remodeling or Use change applicable only to residential dwellings

a. Roofing

i. Overlay $556.00

ii. Tear Off $83.00

iii. Commercial $330.00
b. Replace Driveway $100.00
c. Change of Window or door no structure change $60.00
d. Replace Siding $60.00
e. Decks $180.00
f. Concrete walk or patio $110.00
g. Paver Patio $75.00
h. Handicap Ramp

i. Residential No Fee

ii. Commercial $216.00
i. Detached garage $363.00 + $50.00 PR = $413.00

www.Village Of Monee.org




G.

i- Above Ground Pool $170.00
k. In Ground Pool $430.00 + $50.00 PR = $480.00
I. Shed w/o Electric
i. No concrete pad $88.00
ii. With concrete pad $143.00
m. Fence $120.00
n. Additions/Remodels $143.00 + $50.00 PR = $193.00
o. Lawn Sprinklers — RPZ required $96.00
p. Three season room $253.00 + $50 PR = $303.00
. Electrical
a. Residential
i. Upgrade Service $102.00
ii. Remodel/Addition $143.00 + $50.00 PR = $193.00
b. Commercial - Does NOT INCLUDE Plan Review
i. New Construction $360.00
ii. Remodel $360.00
c. Generators $150.00
Plumbing
a. Residential
i. Installation of clean out $75.00
ii. Remodel/Addition $143.00 + $50.00 PR = $193.00
b. Commercial - Does NOT INCLUDE Plan Review
i. New Construction $360.00
ii. Remodel $360.00
c. Water Heater $75.00
d. Water Softener System $75.00

Heating & Air Conditioning
a. Residential

i. Replacement $75.00
ii. Remodel/Addition $143.00 + $50.00 PR = $193.00
b. Commercial - Does NOT INCLUDE Plan Review
i. New Construction $360.00
ii. Remodel $360.00
. Raising, Shoring, Sealing or Underpinning of structure or Foundation Repairs
a. Residential $120.00
b. Commercial $240.00
Demolition — Foundation/Footing removed $340.00
Signs
a. Change of face only $60.00
b. New structure $120.00 + $50.00 PR = $170.00
. Reinspection/Extra Inspections $100.00

Plan Review - Does NOT INCLUDE Engineering Fees



a. Residential

i. Single Family $700.00
ii. Townhouse-per structure $700.00
iii. Apartment Building

1. Per Floor $700.00
2. Plus Per Unit $70.00
iv. Additions/Stories $105.00

v. Garages $70.00

vi. Miscellaneous $42.00

b. Commercial - $.24 psf minimum $600.00 + Engineering Review Costs

M. Building Code Appeal Application Fee
a. Residential

1. Special Use $190.00
2. Variance $500.00
b. Commercial
1. Special Use $550.00
2. Variance $600.00
N. Occupancy Resale Inspection
a. Residential $50.00
b. Commercial $130.00

0. Dumpster (per Ord 1732) $25.00



I-5-B

ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Village of Monee adopting the 2015 edition of the International
Swimming Pool and Spa Code, regulating and governing the design, construction,
alteration, movement, renovation, replacement, repair and maintenance of swimming
pools, spas, hot tubs, aquatic facilities and related equipment in the Village of Monee;
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees.

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the VILLAGE oF MoNEE does ordain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of
the Village Clerk of the Village of Monee, being marked and designated as the
International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2015 edition as published by the International
Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Swimming Pool and Spa Code of the Village
of Monee, in the State of lllinois regulating and governing the design, construction,
alteration, movement, renovation, replacement, repair and maintenance of swimming
pools, spas, hot tubs, aquatic facilities and related equipment as herein provided;
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of
the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Swimming Pool and
Spa Code on file in the office of the Village Clerk are hereby referred to, adopted, and
made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this legislation, with the additions, insertions,
deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance.

Section 2. The following sections are hereby revised:

Section 101.1. Insert: Village of Monee

Section 105.6.2. Insert: The Fee Schedule as set forth in the building code of the village
established in Table 1 entitled Schedule of Permit Fees shall apply to all mechanical work.

Section 105.6.3: Insert: 50%, 0%
Section 107.4. Insert: MISDEMEANOR, $750.00, 1 DAYS
Section 107.5. Insert: $50.000, $750.00

Section 305.1. Delete Exceptions 1 and 2

Section 3. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is,
for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Mayor and the Board of Trustees hereby

2015 INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE™ 1



declares that it would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 4. That nothing in this legislation or in the Swimming Pool and Spa Code hereby
adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or
any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or
existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 2 of this law; nor
shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this
legislation.

Section 5. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation
to be published. {An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times
the legisiation is to be published and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general
circulation. Posting may also be required.}

Section 6. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect
30 days from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

2 2015 INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND
SPA CODE™



I-5-C

ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Village of Monee adopting the 2015 edition of the International
Residential Code, regulating and governing the construction, alteration, movement, en-
largement, replacement, repair, equipment, location, removal and demolition of de-
tached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses)
not more than three stories in height with separate means of egress in the Village of
Monee; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; repealing
ORDINANCE 1352, 4-13-2005 of the Village of Monee and all other ordinances or parts of
laws in conflict therewith.

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee does ordain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of
the Village Clerk of Village of Monee, being marked and designated as the International
Residential Code, 2015 edition, including Appendix F- Radon Control Methods, Appendix
H- Patio Covers, and Appendix M- Home Day Care, as published by the International Code
Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Residential Code of the Village of Monee, in the
State of Illinois regulating and governing the construction, alteration, movement, en-
largement, replacement, repair, equipment, location, removal and demolition of de-
tached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses)
not more than three stories in height with separate means of egress as herein provided;
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of
the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Residential Code on
file in the office of the Village Clerk are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part
hereof, as if fully set out in this legislation, with the additions, insertions, deletions and
changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance.

Section 2. The following sections are hereby revised:
Section R101.1. Insert: Village of Monee

Section 103.5. Insert: The Fee Schedule as set forth in the building code of the village
established in Table 1 entitled Schedule of Permit Fess, shall apply to all mechanical
work.

Section R105.2. Building. Delete Exception 1, 2, 5, 7, 10
8
ection 202 Add to the Definition of “Dwelling” and “Dwelling Unit”: Any Building that

contains occupied space is considered a Dwelling.



Table R301.2(1) Insert design criteria: Ground Snow Load: 25psf; Wind Design, Speed:
90 mph;, Wind Design, Topographic effects: No; Wind Design, Special Wind Region:
No; Wind Design, Wind-borne debris zone: No; Seismic Design Category: A; Subject to
Damage From Weathering: Severe; Subject to Damage from Frost Line Depth: 42
inches; Subject to Damage from Termite: Negligible; Winter Design Temperture: mi-
nus 3 degrees Fahrenheit; Ice Barrier Underlayment Required: Yes; Flood Hazard:
11/6/2000 FIRM; Air Freezing Index: 2000; Mean Annual Temp: 49.3 degrees Fahren-
heit

Section R313.2. Add additional Exceptions not requiring an automatic fire sprinkler sys-
tem

A. Mixed-use developments, or any phase thereof, that includes single family

units with a density of less than 10 units per acre

B. Single family homes located more than 15 feet from a principle building
single family homes with a density of less than (4) units per acre
D. individual single family homes located on a lot of more than 8,000 square feet

in area.

o

Section R314.8. Add: a heat detector shall be installed in all attached garages of single-
family homes, duplex homes and townhouses. The heat detector shall be intercon-
nected with the interior smoke alarms and shall cause the interior smoke alarms to
sound when activated.

Chapter 11: The village adopted international energy conservation code shall have pri-
ority over this chapter.

Chapter 12-23: The village adopted international Mechanical code shatl have priority
over these chapters.

Chapter 24: The village adopted international Fuel Gas code shall have priority over
this chapter.

Chapter 25-33: The village adopted lllinois plumbing code shall have priority over these
chapters.

Chapter 34-43: The village adopted national electrical code shall have priority over
these chapters.

Section P2603.5.1 Insert: 42 inches, 42 inches

Section 3. That ORDINANCE No. 1352, 4-13-2005 of the Village of Monee and all other
ordinances or parts of laws in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.



Section 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is,
for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Mayor and the Board of Trustees hereby
declares that it would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. That nothing in this legislation or in the Residential Code hereby adopted shall
be construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights ac-
quired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under
any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 2 of this law; nor shall any just
or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this legislation.

Section 6. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation
to be published. (An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times
the legislation is to be published and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general
circulation. Posting may also be required.)

Section 7. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect
30 days from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.



I-5-D

ADOPTION OF
THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Village of Monee adopting the 2015 edition of the International
Property Maintenance Code, regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of
all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and
facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are
safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and struc-
tures unfit for human occupancy and use, and the demolition of such existing structures,
in the Village of Monee; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees there-
for; repealing ORDINANCE 1352, 4-13-2005 of the Village of Monee and all other ordi-
nances or parts of laws in conflict therewith.

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee does ordain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of
the Village Clerk of Village of Monee, being marked and designated as the International
Property Maintenance Code, 2015 edition, including Appendix A — Boarding Standard, as
published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Property
Maintenance Code of the Village of Monee, in the State of lllinois regulating and govern-
ing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair,
location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of electrical systems
as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor;
and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said
Property Maintenance Code on file in the office of the Village Clerk are hereby referred
to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this legislation, with the addi-
tions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance.

Section 2. The following sections are hereby revised:

Section 101.1. Insert: Village of Monee

Section 103.5. Insert: The Fee Schedule as set forth in the building code of the village
established in Table 1 entitled Schedule of Permit Fees shall apply to all mechanical

work.

Add Section 103.6. Any owner or duly authorized agent of any premises shall apply for
an occupancy inspection of said premises upon the following conditions herein.  This
inspection shall be conducted annually upon notification from the building official,
conveyance of premises, sale of premises, or upon tenant change, whichever occurs

2015 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE® 1



first, to determine overall compliance with all the provisions of the property mainte-
nance code. At time of inspection, the unit, common areas, and exteriors will be in-
spected. The owner or duly authorized agent must be present during the inspection.
This inspection must be applied for within two weeks of notification by the building
official.  Prior to inspection the owner, seller, or agent shall provide the building offi-
cial with proof that the sewer, water, and garbage bills are current and no arrearages
are due. If such inspection establishes that the rental unit complies with all the provi-
sions of all applicable provisions, a certificate of occupancy for the premises shall be
issued. In all cases, it shall be unlawful for a new purchaser or lessee to occupy any
portion of the premises until said certificate of occupancy has been issued by the vil-
lage in accordance with this code.

Section 112.4. Insert: $100.00, $750.00

Section 301.2. Add to End: For the purpose of this code, all building occupancy use
types are subject to the restrictions laid out for dwelling units, including commercial
and industrial uses.

Section 302.3. Add to End: these areas shall be paved
Section 302.4. Insert: six inches (6”)

Section 304.14. Insert: April 1°t, December 1%
Section 602.3. Insert: October 1%, May 1%

Section 602.4. Insert: October 1%, May 1%

Section 3. That ORDINANCE No. 1352, 4-13-2005 of the Village of Monee and all other
ordinances or parts of laws in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is,
for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Mayor and the Board of Trustees hereby
declares that it would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any ocne or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. That nothing in this legislation or in the Property Maintenance Code hereby
adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or
any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or ex-
isting, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 2 of this law; nor
shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this
legislation.

2 2015 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTE-
NANCE CODE®



Section 6. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation
to be published. (An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times
the legislation is to be published and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general
circulation. Posting may also be required.)

Section 7. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect
30 days from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

2015 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE® 3



5-E

AN ORDINANCE FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Village of Monee adopting the 2015 edition of the International Fuef Gas Code,
regulating and governing fuel gas systems and gas-fired appliances in the Village of Monee; providing for
the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; repealing ORDINANCE 1352, 4-13-2005 of the Vil-
lage of Monee and all other ordinances or parts of laws in conflict therewith.

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee does ordain as follows:
Section 1. That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the ViLLAGE CLERK
of the Viliage of Monee, being marked and designated as the International Fuel Gas Code, 2015 edition,
including Appendix Chapters A “Sizing and Capacities of Gas Piping”, B “ Sizing of Venting Systems Serv-
ing Appliances Equipped with Drafthoods, Category 1 Appliances and Applian(_:es Listed for use the Type
B Vents”, C “Exit Terminals of Mechanical Draft and Direct Vent Venting Syste'ms” and D ”Recom-
Code Section 101.3, 2015 edition), as published by the International Code Council, be and i is hereby
adopted as the Fuel Gas Code of the Village of Monee in the State of III|n0|s for regulatmg and govern—
ing fuel gas systems and gas-fired appliances a;
and collection of fees therefor; and each andm_il of the regulatlons provisions, penalties, conditions and
terms of said Fuel Gas Code on file in the office of the Village Clerk are hereby referred to, adopted, and
made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this legislation, with the additions, insertions, deletions and
changes, if any, prescribed in Sectlon 2 of this ordmance

Section 2. The fo!loweng sections are hereby rewsed
Section 101:1. insert: Village of Monee

Section 106.6.2. Insert: The Fee Schedule as set forth in the building code of the village established in
Table 1 entitled Schedule of Permit Fees, shall apply to all mechanical work.

Section 106.6.3. Insert: 50%, 0%
Section 108.4. Insert: MISDEMEANGR, $750.00
Section 108.5. Insert: $50.00, $750.00

Section 109.2 Membership of the Board: the Board of appeals shall consist of the members of the zoning
board of appeals of the Village of Monee, Will County, lllinois, acting from time to time.

2015 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE® 1



Section 3. That ORDINANCE No.1352, 4-13-2005 of Village of Monee entitled and all other ordinances or
parts of laws in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is, for any reason,
held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this
ordinance. The Mayor and the Board of Trustees hereby declares that it would have passed this law, and
each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections,
subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. That nothing in this legislation or in the Fuel Gas Code hereby adopted shall be construed to
affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any
cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in
Section 3 of this law; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or af-
fected by this legislation.

Section 6. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation to be published.
{An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times the legislation is to be published
and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general circulation. Posting may also be required.)
Section 7. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and matters estab-
lished and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect 30 Days from and after the date
of its final passage and adoption.

2 2015 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE®



|-5-F

AN ORDINANCE FOR ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Village of Monee adopting the 2015 edition of the International
Fire Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and
explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances,
materials and devices, and from conditions hazardotj:s' to life or property in the occupancy
of buildings and premises in the Village of Monee; providing for the issuance of permits
and collection of fees therefor; repealing ORDINANCE 1047, 4-28-1999 of the Village of
Monee and all other ordinances or parts of laws in conflict therewith.

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee does ordain as follows:
Section 1. That a certain document, three (3} copies of which are on file in the office of

the Viliage Clerk of Village of Monee, being marked and designated as the international
Fire Code, 2012 edition, including Appendix Chapters Appendix B Fire-Flow Requirements
for Buildings {see International Fire Code Section 101.2.1, 2015 edition), as published by
the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the Village
of Monee, in the State of Illinois regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and
property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of
hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or
property in the occupancy of buildings and premises as herein provided; providing for the
issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations,
provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Fire Code on file in the office of the
Village Clerk are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out
in this legislation, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed
in Section 2 of this ordinance.

Section 2. That the following sections are hereby revised:

Section 101.1. Insert: Village of Monee
Section 109.4. Insert: Misdemeanor, $750.00, 30
Section 111.4. Insert: $50.00, 5750.00

Section 202 delete definition for “Area, Building” and insert: Area, Building. The
area included within surrounding exterior walls of a building exclusive of vent shafts

2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE® 1



and courts. Areas of the building not provided with surrounding walls shall be in-
cluded in the building area if such areas are included within the horizontal projection
of the roof or floor above.

Section 202 delete definition for “Fire Area” and insert: Fire Area. The aggregate
floor area enclosed and bounded by exterior walls of a building.  Areas of the building
not provided with surrounding walls shall be included in the fire area if such areas are
included within the horizontal projection of the roof or floor next above.

Section 503.1 Revised the text Where required. “..in accordance with Section
503.1.1 through 503.1.5.

Insert new Section 503.1.4: Additional Access Requirement. Fire apparatus access
roads shall be provided for buildings and structures three or more floors above the
lowest level of fire department vehicle access.  Access shall be provided along at least
75% of each exterior elevation of a building or structure.

Insert new Section 503.1.5: Parking and enforcement. Parking, standing or stopping
shall be prohibited on any fire apparatus access road by any non-emergency vehicle
without the approval of the fire code official.  Signage identifying fire apparatus roads
shall be provided in accordance with state or local motor vehicle laws.  Written per-
mission shall be provided to the Law Enforcement agency having jurisdiction.

Section 503.2 Revised Text: Specifications. “..in accordance with Section 503.2.1
through 503.2.9.”

Section 503.2.3 Revised Text: 503.2.3 Surface. “Fire apparatus access roads shall be
designed and maintained to support a minimum imposed loads-of 72,000 pounds and
shall be surfaced so as to provide all-weather driving capabilities.”

Section 503.2.4 Revised Text: 503.2.4 turning radius.  The required turning radius of
a fire apparatus access road shall include an inside turning radius of not less than 45
feet.

Section 503.2.5 Revised Text: 503.2.5 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access
roads in excess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for turn-
ing around apparatus. Fire apparatus access roads shall have a minimum inside turn-
ing radius of 45 feet and shall have a paved surface of not less than to 27 feet.

Insert new Section 503.2.9: 503.2.9 Placement of fire department access roads. Fire
apparatus access roads shall be placed 25 feet from the building, measured from the
building’s edge to the nearest edge of the access road. Where fire apparatus access
roads are in public or private parking areas, the measurement from the building shall

2018 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE®



be to the rear of the parking stall(s) closest to the drive aisle. Drive aisles shall be a
minimum of 24 feet in width.

505.1 Address identification. Revise the text as follows: “... Shall be not less than 6
inches high with a minimum stroke width of ¥ inch. Interior tenant spaces shall be
identified with characters of not less than 4 inches high. Where required by the fire
official ...”

Add new section 506.3 Key box tamper switch. A key box required by this section
shall be provided with a tamper switch that is supervised by the building fire alarm
system. Activation of the tamper switch shall result in a trouble signai being sent to
the communications center.

Add new section 506.3.1 Knox electronic cut-off switch. A Knox Model (KS-2P) pre-
emptive cut-off switch is required in all buildings of all use groups with multiple elec-
trical panel rooms or locations, or in buildings with a service of 800 or more amps.
The cut-off switch shall be located as follows:

(1) At the entrance to the building as identified by the fire district.
(2} Mounted not less than five (5) feet nor more than six (6) feet above the
adjoining grade.

Section 507.5 Fire hydrant systems. Revise the text as follows: “...shall comply with
Sections 507.5.1 through 507.5.13."

Section 507.5.1 Where required. Revise the text as follows:  “...is more than 300 feet
from a hydrant...”

Section 507.5.1 Delete exceptions 1 and 2.

Add new Section 507.5.7 Hydrants along streets. Fire hydrants shall be located at
street intersections and along public streets at intervals not to exceed 300 feet.

Add new Section 507.5.8 parking restricted. Parking shall not be permitted within
fifteen {10) feet of a fire hydrant measured along the roadway surface in front of the
fire hydrant.

Add new Section 507.5.9 Multiple fire hydrants required. Not less than two (2} fire
hydrants shall be located within 300 feet of a building’s exterior.

Add new Section 507.5.10 Fire hydrants at H-use group occupancies. Where a build-

ing is classified as an “H” use group, the fire chief is authorized to require additional
fire hydrants based on anticipated tactical fireground needs.

2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE® 3



Add new Section 507.5.11 Water main control valves. Not more than two fire hy-
drants located on private property may be taken out of service for the repair of private
property water main.

Add new Section 507.5.12 Distance to roadways, buildings, and grade.  Fire hydrants
shall be located not closer than five (5) feet, nor more than fifteen {15) feet from road
surfaces. Fire hydrants shall be no closer than forty (40) feet to a building. The
main pumper connection (steamer port) shall face the roadway. The center of the
main pumper connection shall be located not less than eighteen (18) inches nor more
than 24 inches above adjoining grade.

Add new Section 507.5.13 Fire hydrant type.  Fire hydrants shall comply with AWWA
Standard C-502. Fire hydrants shall include a minimum six {6) inch distributor water
main supply and a six {6) inch barrel. The main pumper connection shall be a four (4)
inch outlet with two (2), two and % (2.5) inch side outlets. Outlet threads shall by
NST.

Add new Section 511.0 Plan submittals. Plans shall be provided to the fire depart-
ment prior to any new building construction or any additions to buildings which indi-
cate the locations of fire hydrants and sprinkler and/or standpipe connections on ei-
ther public or private property. The location of the fire hydrants and sprinkler and/or
standpipe connections shall be approved by the fire code official.

Section 901.5 revise the text: Installation acceptance testing. “..The fire code offi-
cial shall be notified before any required acceptance testing.  All new fire protection
systems shall be tested in the presence of the fire code official. The installing fire
protection contractor shall notify the fire code official a minimum of forty-eight (48)
hour ahead of any required testing.”

Section 903.4.1 revise the text: Monitoring. “...shall be automatically transmitted to
the fire district’s communications center or by an approved method in accordance with
NFPA 72",

Section 906.3 revise the text: Size and distribution. “..shall be in accordance with
Sections 906.3.1 through 906.3.4.  Fire extinguishers shall be located within 5 feet of

each exit door and as required by Section 906.3.”

Section 907.6.6 revise the text: Monitoring. “...shall be monitored by the fire district’s
communications center or by an approved method in accordance with NFPA 72.7

Section 3. That the geographic limits referred to in certain sections of the 2015 interna-
tional Fire Code are hereby established as follows:

4 2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE®



Section 5704.2.9.6.1 (geographic limits in which the storage of Class | and Class Il lig-
uids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited): Prohibited in Residen-
tiat Districts.

Section 5706.2.4.4 (geographic limits in which the storage of Class | and Class Il liquids
in above-ground tanks is prohibited): Prohibited in Residential Districts.

Section 5806.2 {geographic limits in which the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in
stationary containers is prohibited): Prohibited in Residential Districts.

Section 6104.2 {geographic limits in which the storage of liquefied petroleum gas is
restricted for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas): Prohibited in
Residential Districts.

Section 4. That ORDINANCE No. 1047, 4-28-1999 of the Village of Monee and all other
ordinances or parts of laws in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 5. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is,
for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Mayor and Board of Trustees hereby de-
clares that it would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 6. That nothing in this legislation or in the Fire Code hereby adopted shall be con-
strued to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or
liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or
ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 4 of this law; nor shall any just or legal right
or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this legislation.

Section 7. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation
to be published. {An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times
the legislation is to be published and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general
circulation. Posting may also be required.)

Section 8. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect
30 days from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE® L



I-5-G

ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Village of Monee adopting the 2015 edition of the International
Existing Building Code, regulating and governing the repair, alteration, change of occu-
pancy, addition and relocation of existing buildings, mcludmg historic buildings, in the Vil-
lage of Monee; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; re-
pealing ORDINANCE 1352, 4-13-2005 of the Village of Monee and all other ordinances or
parts of laws in conflict therewith.

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Villagé of Monee dber. ordain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of
the Village Clerk of Village of Monee, being'marked and designated as the International
Existing Building Code, 2015 edition, includiné-App_endix C - Guidelines for wind retrofit
of existing buildings, as published by the Internaf__:ib_nal‘Code Council, be and is hereby
adopted as the Existing Building Code of the Village of Monee, in the State of lilinois reg-
ulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation,
alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of
electrical systems as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection
of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and
terms of said Existing Building Code on file in the office of the Village Clerk are hereby
referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this legislation, with the

additions, msertlons deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordi-
nance. : :

Section 2. The followmg sections are hereby revised:
Section 101.1 Insert: Vlllage of Monee

Section 108.2. Insert: The Fee Schedule as set forth in the building code of the village
established in Table 1 entitled Schedule of Permit Fees, shall apply to all work.

Section 1401.2 Insert: 30 pAYs from and after the date of the final passage and adoption
of this ordinance

Section 3. That ORDINANCE No. 1352, 4-13-2005 of the Village of Monee and all other
ordinances or parts of laws in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is,
for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Mayor and the Board of Trustees hereby
declares that it would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.



Section 5. That nothing in this legislation or in the Existing Building Code hereby adopted
shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under
any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 2 of this faw; nor shall any just
or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this legislation.

Section 6. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation
to be published. (An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times
the legislation is to be published and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general
circulation. Posting may also be required.)

Section 7. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect
30 days from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.



I-5-H

AN ORDINANCE FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Village of Monee adopting the 2015 edition of the international
Mechanical Code, regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials,
erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, reloca on, replacement, addition to,
use or maintenance of mechanical systems in the Village:of Monee; providing for the is-
suance of permits and collection of fees therefor; repééling__ RDINANCE 1352, 4-13-2005
of the Village of Monee and all other ordinances or parts of laws in conflict therewith.

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee does ordain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of
the Village Clerk of Village of Monee, being marked and designated as the International
Mechanical Code, 2015 edition,:including Appendix Chapter A Chimney Co'hhector Pass-
Throughs as published by the |

rnational Code Council, beand is hereby adopted as the
Mechanical Code of the Village of Mone

in.the State of lllinois regulating and governing
the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, lo-
cation, relocation, replacement, addition to, use aintenance of mechanical systems
as herein provided; providing for the issuance of p

its and collection of fees therefor;
and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said
Mechanical Code on file in the office of the Village Clerk are hereby referred to, adopted,
and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this legislation, with the additions, insertions,
delettons and changes if any, prescrlbed in Section 2 of this ordinance.

Section 2. The following sections are hereby revised:
Sectlon 101.1. Insert: Vlllage of Monee

Sectioi 106 5.2. Insert: The Fee Schedule as set forth in the building code of the village
established in Table 1 entttled Schedule of Permit Fees, shall apply to all mechanical
work.

Section 106.5.3. Insert: 50%, 0%
Section 108.4. Insert: MISDEMEANOR, $750.00
Section 108.5. Insert: $50.00, $750.00

Section 109.2 Membership of the Board: the Board of appeals shall consist of the mem-
bers of the zoning board of appeals of the Village of Monee, Will County, lllinois, acting
from time to time.

Section 3. That ORDINANCE No. 1352, 4-13-2005 of the Village of Monee and all other
ordinances or parts of laws in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

2015 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE® 1



Section 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is,
for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Mayor and the Board of Trustees hereby
declares that it would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or mare sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. That nothing in this legislation or in the Mechanical Code hereby adopted shall
be construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights ac-
quired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under
any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 2 of this law; nor shall any just
or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this legislation.

Section 6. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation
to be published. {(An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times
the legislation is to be published and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general
circulation. Posting may also be required.)

Section 7, That this faw and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect
30 days from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

2 2015 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE®



[-5-1

ADOPTION OF THE NFPA 70: NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Viliage of Monee adopting the 2014 edition of the NFPA 70:
National Electrical Code, regulating and governing the design, construction, guality of ma-
terials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, location; relocation, replacement, addi-
tion to, use or maintenance of electrical systems in.t _e Vlllage of Monee; providing for
the issuance of permits and collection of fees theréfor; rep iling ORDINANCE 1352, 4-13-
2005 of the Village of Monee and all other ordinances or part of laws in conflict there-
with. :

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Vi'llage of Monee does o’rgélain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, three {3} copies of which are on file in the office of
the Village Clerk of Village of Manee, being marked and designated as the NFPA 70: Na-
tional Electrical Code, 2014 edition;as published by the National Fire Protection Associa-
tion, be and is hereby adopted as the Elé rical Code of the Village of Monee, in the State
of lllinois regulating and governlng the de5|gn ‘construction quality of materials, erection,
installation, alteration;:
maintenance of ele¢ 'r:cal syste:_ms as herem provided; prowdlng for the issuance of per-
mits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, pen-
alties, conditions and terms of said Electrical Code on file in the office of the Village Clerk
are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this legisla-
tion, wﬂ:h the additlons insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2
of this ordinance.

Section 2. The following sections are hereby revised:
Section 90.4. Insert: Village of Monee as authority having jurisdiction.

Section 90.4. Insert: The Fee Schedule as set forth in the building code of the village
established in Table 1 entitle'd Schedule of Permit Fees shall app!yto all electrical work.

cordingly. Insert Conductors other than copper are not allowed. Exemption: service
conductors owned by utility company

Section 220.1. Insert: Provide a diagram showing service and feeders wire sizes, type
of conductors, calculated loads, the area in square feet being supplied, and demand
factors shall be submitted. Required panel scheduies shall show connected loads, total
connected loads per phase.

Section 210.4 (B) Insert: All switches for fire alarms, burglar alarms, exit signs, and
emergency lighting shall be equipped with mechanical lockouts to prevent an acci-
dental turnoff of the circuits.



Section 300.4. Insert: Except where encased in concrete, all above ground conductors
shall be installed in rigid metal conduit or Electrical metalfic tubing (EMT).

Section 300.5. Add (L): All conductors underground, encased in concrete, or under
buildings shall be installed in PVC conduit. PVC conduit must be listed for any applica-
ble specific locations as required in section 352.12.

Section 408.20 Location of Switchboards and Switchgear add: Anything over 800 Amps
shall have two (2) means of egress with Panic Hardware.

Section 408.20.1 For all Services 800 amps or greater, sprinklers shall not be installed
in electrical rooms. Additionally for all services 800 amp or more, an Electrical Room
that meets all of the following, must be provided: 1). The room is dedicated to electri-
cal equipment only, 2). Only Dry-type electrical equipment is used, 3}. Equipment is
installed in a 2-hour fire-rated enclosure including protection for penetrations, 4}. No
Combustible Storage is permitted to be stored in the room.

Section 410.10 {A) add: Wall mounted exterior Fixtures shall be caulked on the top and
all sides.

Section 700.16 Insert: All emergency egress lighting, illuminated exit signs, and other
emergency lighting shall be of led type

Section 700.21 Insert: All switches for fire alarm, burglar alarm, exit and emergency
lighting circuits shall be equipped with mechanical lockouts to prevent an accidental
turn off of the circuits

Section 3. That ORDINANCE No. 1352, 4-13-2005 of the Village of Monee and all other
ordinances or parts of laws in conflict herewith are herebyrepealed.

Section 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is,
for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Mayor and the Board of Trustees hereby
declares that it would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. That nothing in this legislation or in the Electrical Code hereby adopted shall
be construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights ac-
quired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under
any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 2 of this law; nor shall any just
or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this legislation.

Section 6. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation
to be published. (An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times
the legislation is to be published and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general
circulation. Posting may also be required.)

Section 7. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect
30 days from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.



2016 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE®



[-5-J

AN ORDINANCE FOR ADOPTION OF THE /llinois State Plumbing Code
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Village of Monee adopting the 2014 edition of the /linois Plumbing
Code, regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection,
installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or
maintenance of plumbing systems in the Village of Monee; providing for the issuance of
permits and collection of fees therefor; repealing ORDINANCE No. 874, 10-11-1995 of the
Village of Monee and all other ordinances or part§iof-laws in conflict therewith.

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee does ordain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, three’ (3) copies of which are on file in the office of
the Village Clerk of Village of Monee, belng marked and designated as the flfinois
Plumbing Code, 2014 edition, as published By the lllinois Department of Public Health
(Effective Date of April 24, 2014), be and is hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of the
Village of Monee, in the State of lllincis regulating and governing the design,
construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, location,
relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing systems as herein
provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each
and all of the regulatidhé, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Plumbing
Code on file in the office of the Village Cl':e_rj( are hereby referred to, adopted, and made
a part hereof, as if fully set out i"n'this Iegis!étion with the additions, insertions, deletions
and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of thIS ordinance.

Section 2. The following sections are here / amended as follows:

'Sectlon 890.110 insert paragraph (e}: The Fee Schedule as set forth in the building code
of th_e village of Monee established in Table 1 entitled Schedule of Permit Fees, shall
apply to all electrical work.

Section 890:1200, Paragraph (a) entitled “Water Service Sizing” is hereby deleted and
in lieu thereof is substituted the following:

a). Water Service Pipe Sizing: The water service pipe from the street main (including
the tap) to the water distribution system for the building shall be sized in accordance
with Appendix A, Tables M, N, O, P and Q. Water service pipe and fittings shall be at
least 1” inch diameter. If flushometers or other devices requiring a high rate of water
flow are used, the water service pipe shall be designed and installed to provide this
additional flow.

Section 890.420 Paragraph (a) entitled “Location of Cleanouts within a Building Drain”.
Insert sub-Paragraph 6:



6) A Full size Cleanout shall be located on the exterior of the building within 5’ of the
Foundation on all Building Drains. Exception this exterior Cleanout is not required for
a building Drains that is only used for a RO system.

Section 890.Appendix A Plumbing Materials, Equipment, Use Restrictions and
Applicable Standards as follows:

Under the section entitled “Approved Material for Water Service Pipe” Delete sections
1,2,4,7,8,9,10,11,12,13, 12 AND 15.

Under the section entitled “Approved Material for Water Distribution Pipe” Delete
sections 1,2,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11, and 12.

Under the section entitled “Approved Material for Building Sewer” Delete section 10.

Section 3. That ORDINANCE No. 874, 10-11-1995 of Village of Monee and all other
ordinances or parts of laws in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4, That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is,
for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Mayor and Board of Trustees hereby
declares that it would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. That nothing in this legislation or in the Plumbing Code hereby adcpted shall
be construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under
any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this law; nor shall any just
or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this legislation.

Section 6. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation
to be published. (An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times
the legislation is to be published and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general
circulation. Posting may also be required.)

Section 7. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect
30 Days from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.



I-5-K

AN ORDINANCE FOR ADOPTION OF THE ILLINCIS ACCESSIBILITY CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Village of Monee adopting the current edition of the Hlinois Ac-
cessibility Code, intended to implement the Environmental Barriers Act (EBA) [410 ILCS
25] as amended to date and ensure that the built envirbnment, including all spaces and
elements of all applicable buildings and facilities int te of lllinois is so designed,
constructed, and/or altered to assure the safety and welfare of all members of society
and to be readily accessible to, and usable by, enwronmentaﬂylimlted persons; providing
for the issuance of permits and coilection of fees. e

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee does ordain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file | in the office of
the Village Clerk of Village of Manee, being marked and designated as the lllinois Acces-
sibility Code, current edition, as published by the Illinois Capital Development Board, be
and is hereby adopted as the Accessibility Code of the Village of Monee, in the State of
ILunois regulating and governing all spaces and elements of all applicable buildings and
facilities designed, constructed, and/or altered to assure the safety and welfare of all
members of society and to be readily accessible to, and usable by, environmentally lim-
ited persons as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of
fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and
terms of said Accessibility Code on file in the office of the Village Clerk are hereby referred
to, adopted',f'and'_made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this legislation, with the addi-
tions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance.
Section 2. The following sectlons are hereby revised:

Section 400.180. Insert: The Fee Schedule as set forth in the building code of the village

established in Table 1 entitled Schedule of Permit Fees, shall apply to all work.

Section 400.210 Code Terms: Administrative Authority as used in this code means the

Building Official of the Village of Monee.

Section 400.310.c.7 Signage:  Delete $100 and insert $250
Section 3. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is,
for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Mayor and the Board of Trustees hereby
declares that it would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 4. That nothing in this legislation or in the Accessibility Code hereby adopted shall
be construed to affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights ac-
quired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under



any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 2 of this law; nor shall any just
or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this legislation.

Section 5. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation
to be published. (An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times
the legislation is to be published and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general
circulation. Posting may also be required.)

Section 6. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect
30 days from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

1997 ILLINOIS ACCESSIBLITY CODE



I-5-L.

AN ORDINANCE FOR ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ORDINANCE of the Village of Monee adopting the 2015 edition of the International Building Code,
regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all:property, buildings and structures; by
providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essen-
tial to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of
buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and t"h'% demolition of such structures in the
Village of Monee; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; repealing ORDI-
NANCE No.1341, 2-23-2005 of the Village of Monee-and all other ordmances or parts of laws in conflict
therewith.

The Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee does ordain as folIoiA}S:

Section 1. That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the Village Clerk
of Village of Monee, being marked and designated as the /nternational Building Code, 2015 edition, in-
cluding Appendix Chapters: F Rodent proofing, and | Patio Covers, as published by the International Code
Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Building Code of the Village of Monee, in the State of lllincis for
regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by
providing the standards for supplied-utilities and facilities and © her physical things and conditions essen-
tial to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of
buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures as
herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of
the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Building Code on file in the office of
the Village Clerk are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this legisla-
tion, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance.

Section 2. The fol[owmg sections are hereby revised:
Section 101.1. Insert Village of Monee

Section 202 Delete Definition f r“Area, Building” and Insert: Area, Building. The areaincluded within
surrounding exterior walls of a.

provided with surrounding walls shall be included in the building area if such areas are included within

ilding exclusive of vent shafts and courts.  Areas of the building not

the horizontal projection of the roof or floor above.

Section 202 Add to the Definition of “Dwelling” and “Dwelling Unit”: Any Building that contains occu-
pied space is considered a Dwelling

Section 202 Delete Definition for “Fire Area” and Insert: Fire Area. The aggregate floor area enclosed
and bounded by exterior walls of a building.  Areas of the buitding not provided with surrounding walls



shall be included in the fire area if such areas are included within the horizontal projection of the roof
or floor next above.

Section 202 Delete Definition for “High Rise Building” and Insert: High-Rise Building. A building with
an occupied floor located more than three (3) stories or more than forty (40) feet, above the lowest
level of fire department vehicle access.

Insert new Section 402.9 Mall fire command center. A fire command center for fire department op-
erations shall he provided in a location approved by the fire department. The fire command center shall
meet the requirements of IFC Sections 508.1.1 through 508.1.6.

Section 403.1 Exception: Delete exceptions.

Section 406.5.12 insert new section Automatic sprinkler system. An open parking garage shall be
equipped with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.10.

Section 901.5 delete and insert the following: Acceptance Tests. Fire protections systems shall be tested
in accordance with the requirements of this code and the international Fire Code. When required, the
tests shall be conducted in the presence of the building official. All new fire protection systems shall be
tested in the presence of the fire code official. The installing fire protection contractor shall notify
the fire code official a minimum of forty-eight (48) hour ahead of any required testing. Tests required
by this code, the International Fire Code and the standards listed in this code shall be conducted at the
expense of the owner or the owner’s authorized agent. It shall be unlawful to occupy portions of a
structure until the required fire protection systems within that portion of the structure have been
tested and approved.

Delete Section 903.2.1 and insert: Group A An approved automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
in the locations described below:

Delete Section 903.2.1.1 and insert: 903.2.1.1 Group Al thru A4:

1. In all Group A-1, A-2, A-3 and A-4 occupancies where the occupant load 50 or more.

2. Throughout all levels above and below a Group A-1, A-2, A-3 and A-4 occupancy where the
occupant load is 50 or more. .

3. An automatic fire detection system shall be installed and maintained in buildings with less
than 5000 square feet total area, in building or areas of building not protected by a fire suppression
system.



Delete Section 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, and 903.2.1.6 and renumber Section 903.2.1.5 to read
903.2.1.2.

Delete Section 903.2.3 and insert: Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in all Group
E occupancies.

Delete Section 903.2.4 and insert: 903.2.4 Group F-1 and F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided in all Group F-1 and F-2 occupancies having a fire area of 5,000 square feet or more.

Delete Section 903.2.7 and insert: 903.2.7 Group M and B. An qutomatic sprinkler system shall be pro-
vided in all Group M and B occupancies having a fire area of 5,000 square feet or more.

Delete Section 903.2.8 and insert: 903.2.8 Group R. An gutomatic sprinkler system installed in accord-
ance with Section 903.3 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area. Where
sprinkler protection is permitted to be omitted from a combustible attic area by sprinkler installation
standards, an automatic fire detection system shall be installed in the attic which is designed and in-
stalled in accordance by NFPA 72 with the detection devices supervised by the building’s fire alarm
system.

Delete Section 903.2.9 and insert: 903.2.9 Group S$-1 and S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided in ail Group S-1 and S-2 occupancies having a fire area of 5,000 square feet or more. AnS-1
occupancy used for the storage of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeding 2,500 square feet
shall be provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system.

Delete Sections 903.2.9.1, and 903.2.9.2

Delete Section 903.2.10 and insert: 903.2.10 Group S$-2 enclosed parking garages. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings classified as parking garages in accordance with
Section 406.6 where either of the following conditions exists:

1. Where the fire area of the parking garage exceeds 5,000 square feet.

2. Where the parking garage is located beneath other groups.
. Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies.

Delete Section 903.2.11.3 and insert: 903.2.11.3 Buildings more than three (3) stories or 40 feet in
height. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout buildings that are more than
three (3) stories or forty (40) feet in height above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access
measured to the finished floor.



Insert Section 903.3.5.3: 903.3.5.3 Separation of water services. Fire protection water supplies shall
be separated from domestic supplies outside of the building. Where the water supply separates out-
side of the building a separate control valve for the domestic water supply shall be provided to allow
the domestic water to be shut-off without affecting the sprinkler system water supply.

Insert Section 903.3.9: 903.3.9 Sprinkler and standpipe system design criteria. Hydraulically de-
signed sprinkler and standpipe system designs shall maintain a minimum 10% safety margin between
the seasonal low water supply and the total sprinkler demand. The total sprinkler demand shall in-
clude the sprinkler demand, hose stream demand, and/or standpipe demand. Flow test data used to
determine sprinkler system design shall be less than one (1) year old.

Insert Section 903.4.2.1: 903.4.2.1 Occupant notification. Where an qutomatic sprinkler system
is provided within a building, notification appliances shall be provided in accordance with Section 907.5.

Delete section 903.4.3 and insert: 903.4.3 Floor control valves. Approved supervised indicating
control valves, Waterflow devices, and test/drain devices shall be provided at the point of connection
to the riser on each floor of multiple floor buildings. Bird-cage type fire sprinkler systems are not per-
mitted.

insert Section 903.5.1: 803.5.1 Sprinkler system test valves.  Sprinkler system test valves shall be
mounted not less than five (5) feet nor more than six {6} feet above the finished floor.  Where multipfe
test valves serve a building, each test valve shall be marked in an approved method to indicate what
system it serves.

Insert Section 903.6: 903.6 Floor plans. An approved diagram shall be provided at each automatic
sprinkler riser showing the locations of all control valves on the system and the area in which the riser
serves.

Delete Section 905.3.1 including exceptions 1 and 4, and insert: 905.3.1 Height. “Class | standpipe sys-
tems shall be installed throughout buildings two (2} or more stories in height , or where the floor level
of the towest story is located two (2) or more stories  below the highest level of fire department ve-
hicle access.  An automatic, wet standpipe system shall be provided unless an exception is permitted.

Insert new section 905.3.9: 905.3.9 Storage occupancies. InF and S use groups where warehousing
or storage exceeds twelve (12} feet in height, a standpipe system shall be provided. A2 %inchx 1%
inch connection to the standpipe shall be located immediately inside each exterior door in the vicinity
of the warehousing or storage.  Additional connections shali be provided that no portion of the ware-
housing or storage is more than 120 feet (travel distance) from a standpipe connection. The stand-
pipe system shall be designed as follows:
1. A separate piping system from the overhead sprinklers.
2. Hydraulically calculated for a minimum of 250 gpm at 65 psi to the most
hydraulically remote connection.
3. Where system pressure exceeds 100 psi at a connection, approved
pressure reducing valves shall be provided.



Insert new section 905.3.10: 905.3.10 Building area. In all use groups, where any portion of the inte-
rior of the building is located more than 150 feet {travel distance) from an exterior door, a standpipe
system shall be provided. A2 % inch x 1 % inch connection to the standpipe shall be located immedi-
ately inside each exterior door.  Additional connections shall be provided that no portion of the build-
ing is more than 150 feet (travel distance) from a standpipe connection. The standpipe system shall
be designed as follows:

1. A separate piping system from the overhead sprinklers.

2. Hydraulically calcutated for a minimum of 250 gpm at 65 psi to the most hydraulically
remote connection.

3. Where system pressure exceeds 100 psi at a connection, approved pressure reducing
valves shall be provided.

Insert new Section 905.3.11: 905.3.11 Pressure reducing valves. Where system outlet pressures exceed
100 psi, approved pressure reducing valves shall be provided. All valves shall be 2 % inch and shall be
field adjustable.

Delete Exceptions to section 907.2 and Insert to the end of Section 907.2: An approved manual fire
alarm system shall be installed in all new huildings and tenant spaces of all use groups; and, in all use
groups when a change of occupancy occurs.

Delete any exceptions to required manual fire alarm systems in Sections 907.2.1 through 807.2.23.

Insert in each section 907.2.1 thru 907.2.23: An automatic fire alarm system shall be installed in all new
buildings and tenant spaces as indicated in Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.23 and in the following oc-
cupancies:

1. In commeon areas of all R-1 and R-2 use groups with interior corridors.

2. In alt use groups with a total building area of less than 5,000 square feet unless a super-
vised automatic sprinkler system is provided in the building.

3. In all use groups when a change of occupancy occurs unless a supervised automatic sprin-
kler system is provided within the building or tenant space.

Insert to end of section 907.2.11.2: 4. A heat detector shall be installed in all attached garages of single-
family homes, duplex homes and townhouses. The heat detector shall be interconnected with the
interior smoke alarm(s} and shall cause the interior smoke alarms to sound when activated.

Insert new section 913.6: 913.6 Test header. Where a test header is required it shall be located on
the outside of the building. A bail-drip shall be provided between the control valve for the test header
and the outside test header.

Section 1008.3.3 Rooms and Spaces. Change number 5 to: Public restrooms with an area greater than
50 square feet.

Section 1612.3. Insert: [NAME OF JURISDICTION]} Need FEMA Map numbers???

Section 1612.3. Insert: [DATE OF ISSUANCE] Need FEMA Map numbers???



Section 3. That ORDINANCE No. 1341, 2-23-2005 of ViLLace oF MonEE and all other ordinances or parts of
laws in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is, for any reason,
held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this
ordinance. The Mayor and the Board of Trustees hereby declares that it would have passed this law, and
each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections,
subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. That nothing in this legislation or in the Building Code hereby adopted shall be construed to
affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any
cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in
Section 3 of this law; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or af-
fected by this legislation.

Section 6. That the Village Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation to be published.
(An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times the legislation is to be published
and to specify that it is to be in a newspaper in general circulation. Posting may also be required.)

Section 7, That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and matters estab-
lished and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect 30 days from and after the date
of its final passage and adoption.



VILLAGE of MONEE

Will County Illinois

J-1

ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 1673 RELATIVE TO THE
ISSUANCE OF A SPECIAL USE PERMIT WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF
MONEE, A HOME RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY,

ILLINOIS

ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES
OF THE VILLAGE OF MONEE

THIS DAY OF , 2018

Published in Pamphlet Form by Authority of the
Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee,
Will County, Illinois,

This day of ; 2018

Ordinance Amd Ord 1673 Special Use Permit Page 1 of 4



—_

W O ~N O o B W ha

—_ %
W N = D

14

ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 1673 RELATIVE TO THE
ISSUANCE OF A SPECIAL USE PERMIT WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF
MONEE, A HOME RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY,

ILLINOIS

WHEREAS, on or about January 8, 2014, the Village officials adopted
Ordinance No. 1673 approving the issuance of a Special Use Permit; and

WHEREAS, a condition of the Special Use PermL:_ called for the Applicant to
“have the security personnel on the site fr usk to dawn seven days a
week”; and

WHEREAS, on or about March 27, 20’51':' the Apphcant filed another Special
Use Permit application requesting a modrﬂcat|on to the aforesaid restriction;
and : , .

monitoring by a security company -as comparéd to employing individuals to
perform security services on a daily baS|$__ and

WHEREAS, on or about April 17, 2018, the Appiicant appeared before the
Zoning Board of Appeals and presented testimony relative to the proposed
modification; and

WHEREAS, the Zoning Board of Appeals, upon hearing testimony at the public
hearing determined that an amended special use permit will not be
detrimental to or endanger the public’s health and safety, morals or general
welfare; and

WHEREAS, it was further determined that an amended special use will not be
injurious to the use and enjoyment of property located near the Applicants’
property; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees
of the Village of Monee, that Ordinance No. 1673 be amended as follows:

Section One. Preambles. That the preambles above set forth are
incorporated herein as if set forth herein in full.

Section Two. Conditions. That Section Three of Ordinance 1673 be
amended in that Lines 61 and 62 pertaining to security personnel be repeaied
and replaced with the following language.

Ordinance Amd Ord 1673 Special Use Permit Page 2of4



44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56

57

58

59

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

68

69

70

71

72

73

- That electronic monitoring will be installed and activated on the
Premises and will be in use from dusk to dawn on a daily basis.

Section Three. Savings Clause. That in the event any portion of this
Ordinance is declared to be void, that such other parts or remainder of this
Ordinance shall not be adversely effected and shall otherwise remain effective
and valid.

Section Four. Adoption Clause. That this Ordinance shall be in full force
and effect from and after its approval, adoption gnd_jpublication as required by
law. o

Ordinance Amd Ord 1673 Special Use Permit Page 3of 4



74

75
76
77
78

79

a0

81

82
83
84
85
86
87
88
89
40
N

g2

ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 1673 RELATIVE TO THE
ISSUANCE OF A SPECIAL USE PERMIT WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF
MONEE, A HOME RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY,

ILLINOIS

AYES: NAYS: ABSTAIN: ABSENT: PRESENT:
Blue
Gray
Horne
Holston
Raczek

PASSED and APPROVED this _____ day of __ , 2018,

James Popp, Village Mayor

ATTEST:

Doneshia Codjoe, Village Clerk

Ordinance Amd Qrd 1673 Special Use Permit Page 4 of 4



Will County Illinois

VILLAGE of MONEE ‘

J-2

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 1617 OF THE
VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOME RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL
COUNTY, ILLINOIS

ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES
OF THE VILLAGE OF MONEE

THIS DAY OF , 2018

Published in Pamphlet Form by Authority of the
Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee,
Will County, Illinois,

This day of ;2018

Ordinance Repealing Ord No. 1617 Page 1 of 4



—_

O o =~ L B G M

N N N S T IR TURNE SCO IO R JUREP JURPJC N JC R JU S B Y )
ST ERBEUEHEELS/LLLEEENEERRREEIENEIOI DN TS

ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 1617 OF THE
VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOME RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL
COUNTY, ILLINOIS

WHEREAS, on or about July 25, 2012, the V;ilage of Monee adopted
Ordinance No. 1617; and

WHEREAS, said Ordinance authorized the Village Mayor and Village Clerk to
enter into an Intergovernmental Agreement (“IGA”) with the Village of
Beecher and Village of Peotone relative to the operation of the local
government access channel also known as GAC; and '

WHEREAS, the IGA formed a commission to be named the Tri-Town
Government Access Television Commission; and

WHEREAS, the primary focus of the Commission was to oversee the
operation of the GAC; and

WHEREAS, it has been determined by the municipal officials, that there is no
longer the need for the Commission or the underlying IGA; and

WHEREAS, it has been further determined to be in the best interest of the
Village of Monee to repeal Ordinance No. 1617.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees
of the Village of Monee, a Home Rule Unit of Government, Will County, Illinois,
pursuant to its home rule powers, as follows:

Section One. Preambles. That the preambles above set forth are
incorporated herein as if set forth in full.

Section Two. Repeals Ordinance No. 1617. That Ordinance 1617 adopted
on July 25, 2012, is hereby repealed in its entirety immediately upon the

passage of this Ordinance.

Section Three. Notification. That the Village Clerk is hereby authorized to
notify any and all necessary parties as to the adoption of this Ordinance.

Orcinance Repealing Ord No. 1617 Page 2 0f 4



43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53

Section Four. Savings Clause. That in the event any portion of this
Ordinance is declared to be void, that such other parts or remainder of this
Ordinance shall not be adversely effected and shall otherwise remain effective
and valid.

Section Four. Adoption Clause. That this Ordinance shall be in full force

and effect from and after its approval, adoption and publication as required by
law.

Ordinance Repealing Ord No. 1617 Page 3ol 4



54
9%

56
o7
58
59

60

61

62
63
64
65
66
67
68
59
70

72

ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 1617 OF THE
VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOME RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL
COUNTY, ILLINOIS

AYES: NAYS: ABSTAIN: ABSENT: PRESENT:
Blue
Gray
Horne
Holston
Raczek

PASSED and APPROVED this day of . 2018.

James Popp, Village Mayor

ATTEST:

Doneshia Codjoe, Village Clerk

Ordinance Repealing Ord No. 1617 Page 4 of 4



Will County lllinois

VILLAGE of MONEE “

J-3

ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE GOVERNING THE RAISING OF CHICKEN HENS
WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOME RULE UNIT OF
GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES
OF THE VILLAGE OF MONEE

THIS DAY OF , 2018

Published in Pamphlet Form by Authority of the
Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee,
Will County, Illinois,

This day of 5 2018

Ordinance Governing The Raising of Chicken Hens Page 10f 6



~N G AW Mo

Ww o

20
21
22

23
24

2%

26
27

28

29

30

Kyl
32

ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE GOVERNING THE RAISING OF CHICKEN HENS
WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOME RULE UNIT OF
GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

WHEREAS, the raising or keeping of chickens within municipalities can be
beneficial to the homeowner; and

WHEREAS, regulations and guidelines should be. established with respect to
this type of matter; and .

WHEREAS, it has been determined by the Mayor and Board of Trustees that
regulations or rules be imposed to safeguard the public health, safety and
welfare; and

WHEREAS, it has been deemed appropriate by the Village authorities that it
will be in the best interests of its citizenry to adopt this Ordinance.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees
of the Village of Monee, a Home Rule Unit of Government, Will County, Illinois,
as follows:

Section One—Preambles. That the preambles above set forth are
incorporated herein as if set forth in full.

Section Two - Definitions. The following words, terms and phrases, when
used in this article, shall have the meanings ascribed to them in this section,
except where the context indicates a different meaning:

Chicken coop means an accessory structure, wholly enclosed, used for
the purposes of housing hens.

Hen means the female of the species Callus gallus f. domestica.

Personal poultry license means a license to keep or maintain hens as
provided by this article.

Slaughter means the act of killing an animal for food consumption.
Zoning ordinance means the Village of Monee Zoning Ordinance.

Section Three — License Required.

(a) No person shall keep or raise hens without having first secured a
personal poultry license.

Ordinance Governing The Raising of Chicken Hens Page 2 of &



33

34
35
36
37

38

35
40
41
42

43
44
45
46
47

48

49
50

51
52
53

54
85

56
57

58
59
60

1

62
63
64

(b) There is no fee for a personal poultry license.

Section Four - License Application. Applications for personal poultry
licenses shall be made upon such forms as prescribed by the village. Tenants
seeking a license for rented property must submit a copy of their current lease
and written evidence that the landlord consents to said application.

Section Five — License Rules.

(a) Licenses shall indicate the name of the licensee and the location of
the premises. Licenses issued under this article shall only apply to the
premises described in the application and only one location shall be described
in each license. '

(b) Licenses shall provide for no more than six (6) hens on each
licensed premises, and shall be restricted to properties zoned and utilized as
single family dwellings in the R-1 and R-2, Single Family Residential Zoning
Districts as defined in the zoning ordinance. Roosters and Guinea Hens are
prohibited.

(c) Licensees shall not slaughter hens on the licensed premises.

(d} Hens must be kept within the chicken coop between dusk and
dawn.

(e) The licensed premises shall be constructed and maintained to be
free of rodent infestation and to prevent the collection of standing water;
refuse from the hens shall be disposed of in a clean and sanitary fashion.

(fy  All feed and related items shall be protected in a container with a
tightly fitted lid to prevent rodents from gaining access.

(g) No person shall allow hens to produce noise loud enough to
disturb persons occupying adjacent property.

(h) Hens shall be kept as pets or for personal, non-commercial
purposes only. Breeding or sale of eggs, excrement or any byproduct of the
licensed activity is prohibited.

Section Six - Chicken Coop Requirements.

(a) Each licensed premises shall contain a single chicken coop with
dimensions no larger than 24 square feet in area and six feet in height as
measured from grade, elevated at least 1’ off of the ground.

Ordinance Governing The Raising of Chicken Hens Page 3of 6



65
66
67
68
69
70
71

72
73
74
75
76
77

78
79
80
&1
82

a3
84
85
86
a7
88
89
90
AN
92
93
94
95
95
97

98

99
100

101
102
103

(b) A building permit is required for the construction of a chicken
coop, the outdoor enclosed feeding/grazing area or the installation of a
prefabricated chicken coop; the fee for the building permit will be the same as
for a shed. If electricity is installed to the chicken coop it must be installed
underground; extension cords or above ground wire are not permitted. Any
electrical work requires an electrical permit; the fee shall be the same as for
an accessary structure.

(¢) Chicken coops shalt be located only in a rear yard a minimum of
three feet from any lot line and shall be at least 30! from residential structures
not occupied by the licensee. Chicken coops shall be located at least ten feet
from the principal building and a minimum of five feet from all other buildings
on the licensed premises and abutting properties. Existing non-residential
structures may be allowed for the housing of hens upon staff review.

(d) Chicken coops shall be constructed of solid materials on all sides,
including roof and door(s); the chicken coop must be constructed in such a
manner so as to protect the hens from predators and trespassers, provide
adequate ventilation to minimize odors, allow easy ingress and egress for hens
and protection from weather elements including cold temperatures.

(e) Hens may be allowed outside of the chicken coop between dawn
and dusk only in an enclosed, covered area no larger than 32 square feet and
no taller than six feet. Such area may only be located in a rear yard a
minimum of three feet from any lot and at least 30’ from residential structures
not occupied by the licensee. The screening enclosing this area must be
buried at least 127 deep and 6" flat to prevent predators from digging under
the fence. Construction Requirements; chicken wire shall not be used for
screening. If hardware cloth or welded wire mesh is used for screening, it
must be a minimum of 19 gauge wire. To accommodate free range hens the
outside enclosure may be provided through the use of a mobile screened
enclosure commonly referred to as a chicken tractor. All areas used for the
feeding and grazing shall be maintained to prevent soil erosion and runoff to
neighboring properties. All chicken coops and enclosed feeding/grazing areas
shall be maintained in good, structurally sound repair and in a neat, clean,
presentable and attractive condition.

Section Seven — Inspections.

(a) A license shall not be granted unless the property has been
inspected and the inspector has found compliance with this section.

(b) In addition to any other enforcement authority granted by this
code the Code Enforcement Officer and Building Inspector shall have the
authority to enforce this article.

Ordinance Governing The Raising of Chicken Hens Page 4 of 6



104
106
108
107
108
109
110

1M1
12

13
114
115
16

M7
18
19

Section Eight — License Revocation Hearing. A personal poultry license
may be revoked by the village manager for failure to comply with the
requirements of this article. However, no license shall be revoked until the
licensee is notified and has been given the opportunity to appear at a hearing
before the village manager. Based upon the record of such hearing, the
village manager shall issue a written decision to the licensee. Such revocation
of a license may be in addition to any fine imposed by this Code.

Section Nine — Repealer. That all Ordinances or parts of Ordinances in
conflict herewith are expressly repealed.

Section Ten — Savings Clause. That in thé event any portion of this
Ordinance is declared to be void, that such other parts or remainder of this
Ordinance shall not be adversely effected and shall otherwise remain effective
and valid.

Section Eleven — Adoption Clause. That this Ordinance shall be in full
force and effect from and after its approval, adoption and publication as
required by law.

Ordinance Governing The Raising of Chicken Hens Page 50f 6



ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE GOVERNING THE RAISING OF CHICKEN HENS
WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOME RULE UNIT OF
GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

AYES: NAYS: ABSTAIN: ABSENT: PRESENT:
Gonzalez
Gray
Horne
Holston
Raczek

PASSED and APPROVED this day of , 2018.

James Popp, Village Mayor

ATTEST.:

Doneshia Codjoe0, Village Clerk

Ordinance Governing The Raising of Chicken Hens Page 6 of 5



VILLAGE of MONEE

Will County Illlinois

3-4

ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE REGULATING TRANSIENT MERCHANT TYPE OF
ACTIVITIES WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOME
RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES
OF THE VILLAGE OF MONEE

THIS DAY OF » 2018

Published in Pamphlet Form by Authority of the
Board of Trustees of the Village of Monee,
Will County, Illinois,

This day of , 2018

Ord Regulating Transient Merchant Type Activities Page 10of 9

al




—_

o~ Oy W RS

—_ —a -
LAt B e

13

ORDINANCE NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE REGULATING TRANSIENT MERCHANT TYPE OF
ACTIVITIES WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOME
RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS

WHEREAS, the peddiers and solicitors transient business in the Village of
Monee which provide a service to the residents and commercial segment of
our community; and

WHEREAS, it is essential that these activities be monitored to safeguard the
public health and safety; and

WHEREAS, it has been determined that it is in the best interest of the Village
to compose the following regulations pertaining to peddler type activities.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees
of the Village of Monee, a Home Rule Unit of Government as follows:

Section One. Preambles. That the preambles above set forth are

incorporated herein as if set forth herein in full.

Section Two. Definition. The following words, terms or phrases when

used in this Ordinance shall have the meanings.

Charitable organization means any benevolent, philanthropic, patriotic,
or eleemosynary person or one purporting to be such which solicits and
collects funds for charitable purposes and includes each local, county, or area
division with Illinois of such charitable organization, provided such local,
county, or area division has authority and discretion to disburse funds or
property otherwise them by transfer to any parent organization.

Itinerant vendor means any person who transports tangible personaf
property for retail sale who does not maintain in an established office,
distribution house, sales house, warehouse, service center or residence from
which such business is conducted. However, this does not apply to any person
who delivers tangible personal property who is fulfilling an order for such
property which was solicited or placed by mail or other means. This does not
apply to any person holding a valid license, issued by a county or municipality,
to engage in retail sales.

Ord Regulating Transient Merchant Type Activities Page 20f9



43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
80
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86

Mobile merchant means a transient merchant or business operator who
sells or serves prepared, pre-packaged or unprepared, unpackaged food or
foodstuffs of any kind, non-alcoholic beverages or seasonal items (as defined
below) from a vehicle upon privately owned property. The subject property
shall contain an existing permanent business that operates in a fixed building
with a valid certificate of occupancy or shall contain a business under
construction with a valid building permit. A mobile merchant shall not be
permitted to operate upon public streets, sidewalks, alleys or other public
ways of the village. A mobile merchant shall not be permitted on the same
site for more than one hour in any consecutive four-hour period.

Peddler means any person who shall sell or offer for sale, barter, or
exchange any goods, wares, merchandise or other commodities while traveling
from residence to residence on, along or upon the streets and sidewalks of the
village.

Solicitation means and inciudes any one or more of the following
activities:

(1) Seeking to obtain orders for the purchase of goods, wares,
merchandise, foodstuffs or services of any kind, character or
description whatsoever, for any kind of consideration whatsoever,

(2) Seeking to obtain prospective customers for application for or
purchase of insurance of any type, kind or character;

(3) Seeking to obtain subscriptions to books, magazines, periodicals,
newspapers or any type of publication;

(4) Seeking to obtain gifts or contributions of money, clothing or any
other valuable thing for the support or benefit of any charitable or
nonprofit association, organization, corporation or project;

(5) Seeking to enlist support for or against a particular religion,
philosophy, ideology, political party, issue or candidate, whether
accepting donations of money or not, or distributing handbills or
flyers advertising any event or service;

(6) Seeking to advertise, promote, sell and/or explain any product,
service, organization or cause; and

(7) Includes hawkers, itinerant vendors, peddlers, and transient
merchants.

Ord Regulating Transient Merchant Type Activilies Page 3 of 9



87
88
89
90
91
92
93
94
95
9%
97
88
89
100
101
102
103
104
105
106
107
108
108
10
11
12
13
114
15
16
17
18
119
120
121
122
123
124
125
126
127
128
129

Transient merchant means any person who is engaged temporarily in
the retail sale of goods, wares or merchandise and who, for the purpose of
conducting such business, occupies any building, room, vehicle, structure of
any kind, or vacant lot, and includes mobile merchants and stationary
merchants. However, this does not apply to any person selling goods, wares
or merchandise which are raised, produced or manufactured by him, to any
person selling vegetables, fruit or perishable farm products at an established
city or village market, to any person operating a store or refreshment stand at
a resort, to any person operating a stand or booth on or adjacent to property
owned by him or upon which he resides, to any person operating a stand or
booth at a state or county fair, or to any person operating a stand or booth at
a trade show, exposition, convention or similar event. This does not apply to
any person holding a valid license, issued by a county or municipality, to
engage in retail sales.

Section Three: Soliciting. All solicitors must comply with the provisions

of this Ordinance. It is hereby declared to be the policy of the Village of
Monee that the occupants of each residence to make the determination to
whether solicitors shall or shall not be invited to their respective residence.

Section Four: Posting of Notice by Occupant.

(a) Every person desiring to secure the protection intended to be
provided by the regulations pertaining to soliciting contained in this article
shall comply with the directions set forth in this section.

(b) Notice of the determination by the occupant of the refusal of
invitation to solicitors to any residence shall be given in the manner following:

(1) A weatherproof card or decal, at least three inches by four
inches (eight centimeters by ten centimeters) in size, shall
be exhibited upon or near the main entrance door to the

residence, indicating the determination by the occupant,
containing the applicable words, as follows:

NO SOLICITORS INVITED
or

NO SOLICITORS

Ord Reguiating Transient Merchant Type Activities Page 4 of 9



130
131
132
133
134
135
136
137
138
138
140
141
142
143
144
145
146
147
148
149
180
161
162
163
154
155
156
157
158
159
160
161
162
53
164
165
166
167
168
169
170
171
172
173

(2) The letters shall be at least one-third inch (eight
millimeters) in height.

(c) Such card so exhibited shall constitute sufficient notice to any
solicitor of the determination by the occupant of the residence of the
information contained thereon.

Section Five: Duty to Comply.

(a) It shall be the duty of every solicitor, upon going onto any
premises in the village upon which a residence is located, to first determine
whether the notice provided for in this article, if any, is attached, and to
further be governed by the statement contained on the notice. If the notice
states "NO SOLICITORS INVITED” OR “NO SOLICITORS,” then the solicitor,
whether registered or not, shall immediately and peacefully depart from the
premises,

(b) Any solicitor who has gained entrance to any residence, whether
invited or not, shall immediately and peacefully depart from the premises
when requested to do so by the occupant.

(c) It is hereby declared unlawful and a trespass for any person to go
upon any premises and ring the doorbell upon or near any door, or create any
sound in any other manner calculated to attract the attention of the occupant
of such residence, for the purpose of securing an audience with the occupant
thereof and engage in soliciting, in defiance of the notice exhibited at the
residence in accordance with the provisions of this article.

(d) It is hereby declared unlawful and a nuisance for any person,
whether or not licensed under this chapter, to go upon any premises and ring
the doorbell upon or near any door of a residence located thereon, or rap or
knock upon any door, or create any sound in any other manner calculated to
attract the attention of the occupant of such residence, for the purpose of
securing an audience with the occupant thereof and engaging in soliciting,
prior to 10:00 a.m. or after 6:00 p.m. Monday through Friday.

Section Six: License required. All solicitors shall comply with the
licensing requirements as set herein.

Section Seven: License Issuance.

(a) Application. All applicants shall submit, in addition to a completed
application, a nonrefundable application processing fee of $100, a certificate

Ord Regulating Transient Merchant Type Activities Page 5of 9



174
175
176
177
178
179
180
181
182
183
184
185
186
187
188
189
190
191
192
193
194
195
196
197
198
169
200
201
202
203
204
205
206
207
208
209
210
211
212
213
214
215
216
217

showing liability insurance, the department of the treasury employer
identification number, and a health department food service establishment
inspection report, if applicable.

(b) Issuance of license. Within ten business days of filing the
application, after consideration, investigation and review of the application,
each solicitor who is found to be fully qualified, shall be issued a license, and
shall deposit the sum of $50.00 for said license.

(c) Persons ineligible for certificate. No license shall be issued to any
person who, within five years of the date of the application:

(1) Has made a false material statement in a soliciting
application;

(2) Has been convicted of the commission of (i) a felony, or (ii),
a misdemeanor involving dishonesty or false statements,
under the laws of the state or any other state, or under the
taws of the United States;

(3) Has violated any of the provisions of this chapter, any other
provision of this Code applicable to the activities of a
solicitor, or the ordinances of any other municipality
regulating soliciting, within one year of the date of the
application;

(4) Has had his license issued under this chapter revoked as
provided in this article;

(5) Is required to register as a sex offender under the Illinois Sex
Offender Registration Act, 730 ILCS 150/3, under the laws of
any other state, or under the laws of the United States;

(6) Perpetrated fraud or misrepresentation in the course of
conducting solicitation, distribution of peddling activities;

(7) Conducted solicitation, distribution or peddling activities in
such a manner as to create a public nuisance; or

(8) Does not otherwise meet the requirements of this chapter.
Section Eight: Display of License. Each license shali at all times while

soliciting within the village carry upon his person the license as required by
this chapter which shall be worn in such a way as to be conspicuous.

Ord Regulating Transient Merchant Type Activities Page 6 of 9



218
219
220
24
222
223
224
225
276
227
228
229
230
231
232
233
234
235
236
237
238
239
240
241
242
243
244
245
245
247
248
249
250
251
252
253
254
255
256
257
258
259
260

Section Nine: License revocation. Any license issued under this article
shall be revoked by the chief of police if the licensee:

(1) Violates any of the provisions of this chapter;
(2) Has made a false material statement in the application;

(3) Perpetrates a fraud or misrepresentation in the course of
conducting solicitation, distribution of peddling activities;

(4) Conducts solicitation, distribution or peddling activities in
such a manner as to create a public nuisance; or

(5) Otherwise becomes disqualified for the issuance of a license
under the terms of this article.

Section Ten: Appeal of license denial or revocation,

(a) Any person aggrieved by the denial or revocation of a
license under the provisions of this article shall have the right to appeal to the
village president within 21 days after the date of denial of the application or
revocation of the license. The appeal must be in writing, and shall contain a
specific request for or waiver of a hearing.

(b) If a hearing is requested, the hearing before the village
president shall take place within 30 days of the written appeal. The village
president shall not be bound by the rules of evidence in the courts of law, but
shall, in ascertaining the conditions and practices involved in the decision
appealed, take into account all reliable, probative and substantial evidence.
The village president shall issue a written decision within 14 days of the
hearing.

(€) Where a hearing is waived, the appealing party shall submit
all supporting documentation with the written appeal. The village president
shall issue a written decision within 14 days of filing of the written appeal.

(d) The village president’s determination as to the denial or
revocation of a license shall be a final administrative decision and subject to
review in the circuit court of Will County, Illinois. The provisions of the
administrative review law, and the rules adopted pursuant thereto, shall apply
to and govern.

Ord Regulating Transient Merchant Type Activities Page 7 of 9



261
262
263
264
265
266
267
268
259
270
271
272
273
274
275
276
277
278

279

280

281

282

283

284

285

286

287

288

289

290

pathl

202

Section Eleven. Transient Merchants, Peddlers, Itinerant Vendors.
Every transient merchant or itinerant vendor desiring to engage in soliciting
within the village is required to obtain a license. Stationary merchants must
also obtain a temporary use permit.

Section Twelve: Repealer. That all Ordinances or parts of Ordinances in
conflict herewith are expressly repealed.

Section Thirteen: Savings Clause. That in the event any portion of

this Ordinance is declared to be void, that such other parts or remainder of
this Ordinance shall not be adversely effected and shall otherwise remain
effective and valid.

Section Fourteen: Adoption Clause. That this Ordinance shall be in full

force and effect from and after its approval, adoption and publication as
required by law.

Ord Regulating Transienl Merchant Type Activities Page 8of 9



293 ORDINANCE NUMBER

294 AN ORDINANCE REGULATING TRANSIENT MERCHANT TYPE OF
295 ACTIVITIES WITHIN THE VILLAGE OF MONEE, A HOME
296 RULE UNIT OF GOVERNMENT, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS
297
298
299

AYES: NAYS: ABSTAIN: ABSENT: PRESENT:

Blue
Gray
Horne

Holston

Raczek
300
301
32 PASSED and APPROVED this day of , 2018.
303
304
305
306 James Popp, Village Mayor
307
308
e ATTEST:
310 Doneshia Codjoe, Village Clerk

Ord Regulating Transient Merchant Type Activitios Page 90of &



Village of Monee

Agenda ltem: L -2
Meeting Date: April 26, 2018
Subject: First Amendment to Redevelopment Agreement

By: David Wallace, Administrator

Board Action Request

Up for your consideration is the first amendment to the Redevelopment Agreement with Dr. Paul
Scheetz (JPEL). Under Section 3 A of the redevelopment agreement calls for the entire project
to be substantially completed by December 31, 2017, The west unit of the building has met the
terms of the agreement while the east unit of the building has not. Therefore, Dr. Schestz is
requesting an extension of time to October 1, 2018 to substantially complete the east unit of the
building and locate a commercial business in the same.

Attached for your review is a signed copy of the First Amendment to the Redevelopment
Agreement for your review.

Action Requested:  Motion to authorize the Mayor and Clerk to sign the First Amendment to
Redevelopment Agreement.



FIRST AMENDMENT TO REDEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT BY

e e e e e e S\ oot e A =

AND BETWEEN THE VILLAGE OF MONEE AND JPEL

This First Amendment to Redevelopment Agreement (the “Redevelopment
Agreement”) is made and entered into as of this 12 of July, 2017, by and between the
Village of Monee, an Illinois municipal corporation located in Will County, Illinois (the
“Village”), and JPEL, INC (the “Developer”).

AR YR TR e Sy ——

WHEREAS, on or about July 12, 2017, the Village of Monee (“Village”) entered
into a Redevelopment Agreement with JPEL, INC. (“The Developer”) pertaining to the
redevelopment of an existing facility located at 25646 S. Govemors Highway (“the
Project™); and

WHEREAS, the project consisted of renovating the facility to accommodate a
chiropractic business operation and would also include the buildout to allow for a wine
bar restaurant; and

WHEREAS, the Developer acknowledges the importance to the Village of the
wine bar restaurant segment of the facility; and

WHEREAS, the Redevetopment Agreement called for the substantial completion
of the entire Project by December 31, 2017; and

WHEREAS, the Village and the Developer met in December of 2017 to discuss
various issues relative to the Project; and

WHEREAS, the Developer has requested an extension pertaining to the
completion of the wine bar restaurant or other commercial type use; and

WHEREAS, the parties herein are desirous of the Project being completed as
soon as possible in order to promote further continued economic growth, along
Governors Highway; and

WHEREAS, after full consideration of the underlying facts, the parties believe it
1o be in the best interest to enter into this First Amendment.

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual promises contained herein,
the parties agree as follows:

Section 1. Preambles. The preambles and premises set forth above are an
integral part of this First Amendment to Redevelopment Agreement and are hereby
incorporated into and made a part of this Redevelopment Agrecment as though they were
fully set forth in this Paragraph.




Section 2.  Extension of Time. That the Developer is hereby granted a time
extension to October 1, 2018 to fully complete the wine bar restaurant or other
commercial type use inside the facility. Any and all plans shall be submitted to the
Village for review in order to insure compliance with the applicable building and zoning
codes.

Section 3. No_Admission of Liability. That neither party is admitting any
type of liability or wrongdoing by executing this First Amendment.

Section 4. Remaining Terms and Provisions. That all other remaining terms,
provisions and conditions set forth in the Redevelopment Agreement shall remain in full
force and effect.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this First

Amendment day of April, 2018
YILLAGE: VILLAGE OF MONEE, an
Illinois Municipal Corporation
(SEAL)
BY:
Mayor
Attest:
Village Clerk
EVELM%
BY: < G
aul Scheetz
Attest:

Acknowledged: First Community Bank gnd Trust
Y = N =T

monee misclfirst amd to rda jpel



Village of Monee

Agenda tem: L -3
Meeting Date; April 26, 2018
Subject: TIF Payout Request

By: David Wallace, Administrator

Board Action Request

Up for your consideration is a TIF Payout request for JPEL (Dr. Paul Scheetz) project, located at
25646 S. Governor's Highway in the amount of $195,000. All submitted TIF eligible expenses
have been reviewed by Teska Associates, Inc. and found to be in order. This payout request is
in accordance with Section 5 of the redevelopment agreement.

Action Reguested:  Motion to autherize the TiF payment amount of $185,000 per the terms of
the Redevelopment Agreement and Redevelopment Note.



